Y e www.govtpressmp.nic.in
Y off TR dre fFar o1 gar &

|

SHIF 500 ] AIe, TEaR, feais 6 fagraR 2012— 18T 15, TF 1934

faum g gfaae™, qeayey

e, feaie 6 faasr 2012

. 24855-T0.9.-fqum-2012. —Heauew faum @ % uftren qeon wrd doem wwre fe 64 & SuEdl & Ued
H Aeryew AAfyeaa weam fafy (dene) fadaes, 2012 (A 31 TF 2012) S faum @ # foiw 6 femww, 2012
1 R T 8. SHEMERT & g7 F fau ywifem frar sm @

999



1000 Hegyeyl Uy, fariew ¢ fewm= 2012

TeaueyT fasraen

A 3% W R08R

mm_mm(mﬁwm, 302%.

weauSer stfuaea oA fafy sifufem, gke @ it delfua @ ¥q fadae.

qRA TR F faegsd ad § weayy faum-ved gr fefafed w9 o g sifufrafsa 21—

e W, . 79 Afufray w1 dfa T weawRy stfves seam ffy (geed) sifufTad, 02 ©.

ST Re T 3. meAyRy stfudenn el ffy sifufram, ¢’ (AR § G 2%¢Rr) (S TUH TR TYEI

e, o afufrm ¥ 9 @ e 2) 3 aw o § S () ¥ wm w, At e weifd @
S, Al —

(o) T uER, meyey fafug oftg grr S E stemien W, TR wew H SR U Ofd
H, Shon for fafug ofteg % et @ fafea foran s, o w9g SR o= SUT Hed
% ST w2, 59w wee ¢ neyey sifuadar seamn fAfy wr sifea g1, qfka
St a1 gfxa At 3R 3w faawo IR fasma 7g fafug aiug %1 9e@ 2o yiavd
FHHEH & MER W forar s

gRT R} T 3. o offufEm @ ar| gk H—
(Th)  SUER (2) H w 'eE wA % WM W, wee g wuw’’ wenfyd fe S
() SuEW (R) § weg Vg w0’ % WM W, v ge w90’ wnfid e S
IVl 3T HWUN T HIA

TAAM § I e SR s el ¥ wRe fFU SM o SYgSiia S99 HEY: o TUY 3R o
¥qU qed & Afegean wear ffy wmn ame st w® €

. T W & famd § ura g 9 TS o S stfyeaaietl & fan uod s W searenl dsed
& fFarae ¥ foar S 8 erafues gerewifa & SR, qeauew oifygen wear fafy sAfufmm, 2’¢x (FH®
T QR¢R) & 31T TR W Wl Fedwehid Ao TR ' § yonfad g8 € owwm, o sifuftem o erdi @
SA A W # ed Selh S IEed ¥ o TIY W 4o TUU AUl STHRY Tl qel ST WifkeRon/
Syl H o ¥TUT F Qo TUC fHaAr I wwAfed ¥ o: o ofuftam @t " g¢ R R W wHfud Heem

3. ofd: I fqvesd U €.

O =, Wy fasm
qE 9 TIE, 02R. YRS T,

Tei=eh, TR GE0 991 SEA S, WAyl §R YERIT HEE gRoerd, rare | g a0 wehifie— 2012,



T JadTEe www.govtpressmp.nic.in
off TRA die fmar s g .

[

S 506 ] e, YR, feaiew 7 feamer 2012—3wRrEw 16, W 1934

fafy oiiv faurh wrf faam

Hrared, fedieh 7 feamr 2012
. 7544-363-3FRME-J(W.). — YR % WM F STI=¢ 348 & WUS (3) % STIEW H, meayew Afuae
el Aty (EHeed) fagemes, 2012 (FAFE 31 G 2012) &1 STUSH S ARG TSIUE % ISR ¥ TAGERI Wl
IERIESIGIES

TETYRY % TSI o AW W TAT STRIMER,
TSAIT e, AR Giea.

1011



1012 HeAyey Tous, fedie 7 fggwaw 2012

MADHYA PRADESH BILL
No. 31 or 2012,

THE MADHYA PRADESH ADHIVAKTA KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN)
VIDHEYAK, 2012.

A Bill further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third year of the Republic of
India as follows —
Short fitle. I. This Act may be called Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Adhiniyam, 2012. -

Amendment of 2. In Section 18 of the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982
Section 18. (No.9 of 1982) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), for sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:—

“(1) The State Government shall, on the requisition made by the Bar Council of

Madhya Pradesh, print or cause to be printed in such form and in such manner

- as may be prescribed in consultation with the Bar Council, adhesive stamps

bearing the words “Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi Stamp” of the value

of twenty rupees and fifty rupees for being supplied to the Bar Council for
distribution and sale on 10 percent commission basis.".

Amendment of 3. In Section 19 of the principal Act,—
Section 19.

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “ten rupees”, the words “twenty rupees” shall
be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (2), for the words “twenty rupees”, the words “fifty rupees” shall
be substituted. ‘

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

At present Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi stamps worth Rs. 20 and Rs. 10 are being affixed

fﬁe memo of appearance
filed before the High Court and subordinate courts respectively. . '

2. The revenue received from the sale of these stamps are utilized for the implemestation of welfare schemes
of the Advocates. Due to high inflation the welfare schemes run under the Madhya Pradesh Adhivakta Kalyan Nidhi
Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 9 of 1982) are seriously affected. Hence it is proposed to increase the value of the stamp affixed
under the principal Act from Rs. 20 to Rs. 50 in the High Court and Rs. 10 to Rs. 20 in the subordinate courts and
in other authorities /Tribunals. Therefore suitable amendments are proposed in Section 18 and 19 of the principal Act.

3. Hence this Bill.

BHOPAL : DR. NAROTTAM MISHRA
DATED the 27" November, 2012. Member-in-Charge.

i, YTHea qEU 991 s OTmf, Hegyivl g NS Hy qEoner, Hidie 9§ Hfd qu1 g —2012.



