
XIV of
1869.

L. A. BILL No. VII OF 2015.

A BILL

further to amend the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Civil
Courts Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted
in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Civil Courts
(Amendment) Act, 2015.

Short title
and
commencement.

(1)

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 6, +ÆEò 6(3)] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®úú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 11, 2015/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 20, ¶ÉEäò 1936 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 4, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 18

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ
Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Civil Courts  (Amendment) Bill, 2015 (L.A. Bill No. VII
of 2015) introduced in the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 11th March 2015, is hereby
published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

M. A. SAYEED,
Principal Secretary and R.L.A. to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————---------------

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö----18--1



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 11, 2015/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 20, ¶ÉEäò 19362

Transfer of
pending
appeals.

Mah. ....
of 2015.

XIV of
1869.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Act”), for the words “ten lakh rupees” the
words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the words “ten lakh rupees”
the words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

4. In section 28A of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “ten lakh rupees” the words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

5. After section 28B of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“28C. On the commencement of the Maharashtra Civil Courts
(Amendment) Act, 2015, all appeals in which the amount or value of
the subject matter does not exceed one crore rupees and pending
before the High Court immediately before such commencement, shall
stand transferred to the concerned District Court and such District
Court may deal with such appeal from the stage which was reached
before such transfer or from any earlier stage or de-novo as such court
may deem fit:

Provided that, this section shall not apply to any appeals which
are pending before the High Court, which are statutorily provided
under the relevant enactment before such Court.”.

 Amendment of
section 16 of
XIV of 1869.

 Amendment of
section 26 of
XIV of 1869.

 Amendment of
section 28A  of

XIV of 1869.

 Insertion of
section 28C

in XIV of
1869.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 11, 2015/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 20, ¶ÉEäò 1936 3

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Under the existing provisions of the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act
(XIV of 1869), the pecuniary appellate jurisdiction of the District Court
with regard to the amount or value of the subject matter for the purpose
of appeal is upto ten lakh rupees and of the High Court exceeding ten lakh
rupees.

2. With the passage of time the rates of properties in the cities and
mofussil areas of the State have been tremendously increased since the
year 2011 when the pecuniary appellate jurisdiction of the District Court
was lastly enhanced from two lakh rupees to ten lakh rupees and the
litigants have to file the appeal in the High Court when the amount or
value of the subject matter of the suits exceeds ten lakh rupees. As a result
thereof, there is rise in filing of the appeals in the High Court. The first
appeal is filed in the High Court under the Code of Civil Procedure, 1908
(V of 1908) and certain other laws. The filing of such first appeal is one of
the main reason for increase in number of appeals in the High Court.
Considering this and the commitment of the State Government to bring
justice at the door-step of the common man, the State Government considers
it expedient to enhance the said pecuniary appellate jurisdiction of the
District Court from ten lakh rupees to one crore rupees. To achieve these
purposes, it is proposed to amend sections 16, 26 and 28A of the said Act,
suitably and to insert new section 28C in the said Act. This will facilitate
the District Judges to entertain the appeals arising from the decrees
passed by the Civil Judge, the amount or value of the subject matter of
which does not exceed one crore rupees. Thus, only the appeals arising
from the decree, the amount or value of the subject matter of which
exceeds one crore rupees, will be decided by the High Court. This will
certainly save the expenses and avoid inconvenience to the litigants.

3. The State Government also considers it expedient to transfer, by
inserting new section 28C in the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act (XIV of
1869), all such appeals in which the amount or value of the subject matter
does not exceed rupees one crore and which are pending before the High
Court, to the concerned District Court.

4. The Bill intends to achieve the above objectives.

Mumbai, DEVENDRA FADNAVIS,
Dated the 10th March 2015. Chief Minister.



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É ö̀ú, ¨ÉÉSÉÇ 11, 2015/¡òÉ±MÉÖxÉ 20, ¶ÉEäò 19364

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Bill involves the following proposal for delegation of legislative
power, namely :—

Clause 1(2).—Under this clause, power is taken to the State
Government to bring the Act into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. The above-mentioned proposal for delegation of legislative power
is of a normal character.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY  SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI, PRINTED

AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING,

STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004, EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI.


