
Øe-la[;k&193 ¼d&1½ jftLVªs'ku uEcj&,lå,låihå@,yå 
 MCywå@,uåihå&91@2014&16 

 ykblsUl Vw iksLV ,sV dUls'kuy jsV 

 

—

¼mŸkj çns'k v/;kns'k½ 

 

&&&&&&& 
la[;k  511@79-fo-1&2022-2-d-8-2022 

y[kuÅ] 4 vDVwcj] 2022 
&&&&&& 

vf/klwpuk 

Hkkjr dk lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M ¼1½ }kjk iznRr 'kfDr dk iz;ksx djds jkT;iky egksn;k 
}kjk fuEufyf[kr mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2022 ¼mRrj izns'k v/;kns'k 
la[;k 8 lu~ 2022½ ftlls iapk;rhjkt vuqHkkx&2 iz'kklfud :i ls lEcfU/kr gS iz[;kfir fd;k x;k gS tks 
bl vf/klwpuk }kjk loZlk/kkj.k dh lwpukFkZ izdkf'kr fd;k tkrk gSA 

mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2022 
¼mRrj izns'k v/;kns'k la[;k 8 lu~ 2022½ 

[Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds frgRrjosa o"kZ esa jkT;iky }kjk iz[;kfir] 
mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 dk vxzrj la'kks/ku 

djus ds fy, 
v/;kns'k 

pw¡fd jkT; fo/kku e.My l= esa ugha gS vkSj jkT;iky dk ;g lek/kku gks x;k gS 
fd ,slh ifjfLFkfr;k¡ fo|eku gSa] ftuds dkj.k mUgsa rqjUr dk;Zokgh djuk vko';d gks 
x;k gS( 

vr,o] vc] Hkkjr dk lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 213 ds [k.M ¼1½ }kjk çnRr 'kfDr;ksa 
dk ç;ksx djds] jkT;iky fuEufyf[kr v/;kns'k ç[;kfir djrh gSa %& 

1&;g v/;kns'k mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r ¼la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 
2022 dgk tk;sxkA 

laf{kIr uke  

 



2 mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 4 vDVwcj] 2022  

575   RPH vidhaika- 2021 folder adhyadesh (panchayat) 7-10-2022 data 4e 

 

mRrj izns'k 
vf/kfu;e la[;k 33 
lu~ 1961 dh  
/kkjk 15 dk 
la'kks/ku 

2&mRrj çns'k {ks= iapk;r rFkk ftyk iapk;r vf/kfu;e] 1961 ¼ftls vkxs ewy 
vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 15 esa]&  

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼11½ esa 'kCn ^^vk/ks ls vf/kd^^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^vU;wu  

nks-frgkbẐ ^ j[k fn;s tk;saxs( 

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼13½ esa 'kCn ^^,d o"kẐ ^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^nks o"kẐ ^ j[k fn;s 
tk;saxsA 

/kkjk 28 dk 
la'kks/ku 

3&ewy vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 28 esa]& 

¼d½ mi/kkjk ¼11½ esa 'kCn ^^vk/ks ls vf/kd^^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^vU;wu  

nks-frgkbẐ ^ j[k fn;s tk;saxs( 

¼[k½ mi/kkjk ¼13½ esa 'kCn ^^,d o"kẐ ^ ds LFkku ij 'kCn ^^nks o"kẐ ^ j[k fn;s 
tk;saxsA 

 

 vkuanhcsu iVsy] 
 jkT;iky] 
 mRrj izns'kA 
 

&&&&& 

 vkKk ls] 
 vrqy JhokLro] 
 izeq[k lfpoA 
 

&&&&& 
 

No. 511/LXXIX-V-1–2022-2-ka-8-2022 

 Dated Lucknow, October 4, 2022 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                      

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India,  the 

Governor is pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh 

Kshettra Panchayats tatha Zila Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022 (Uttar Pradesh Adhyadesh 

Sankhya 8 of 2022)  promulgated by the Governor. The Panchayati Raj Anubhag-2 is administratively 

concerned with the said Ordinance. 

THE UTTAR PRADESH KSHETTRA PANCHAYATS AND ZILA PANCHAYATS 

(SANSHODHAN) ADHYADESH, 2022 

(U.P. ORDINANCE NO. 8 OF 2022) 

[Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy third Year of the Republic of India] 

AN 

ORDINANCE 

 further to amend the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and  Zila Panchayats 

Adhiniyam 1961. 

WHEREAS the State Legislature is not in session and the Governor is satisfied that 

circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action; 

 



 mRrj izns'k vlk/kkj.k xtV] 4 vDVwcj] 2022 3 

575  RPH vidhaika- 2021 folder adhyadesh (panchayat) 7-10-2022 data 4e 
 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of  

Article 213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to promulgate the 

following Ordinance:- 

1. This Ordinance may be called the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and 

Zila Panchayats (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2022.
 

Short title 

2. In section 15 of the Uttar Pradesh Kshettra Panchayats and Zila Panchayats 

Adhiniyam, 1961 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),- 

(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words  

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year", the words  

"two years" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of  

section 15 of  

U.P. Act no. 33  

of 1961 

3. In section 28 of  the principal Act,- 

(a) in sub-section (11), for the words "more than half", the words  

"not less than two-third" shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (13), for the words "one year",  the words  

"two years" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of  

section 28 

 

 
 
 
 ANANDIBEN PATEL, 
 Governor, 
 Uttar Pradesh. 
 

——— 
 

 By order, 
 ATUL SRIVASTAVA, 
 Pramukh Sachiv. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
ih0,l0;w0ih0&,0ih0 575 jkti=&2022&¼934½&599 izfr;ka&¼dEI;wVj@Vh0@vkWQlsV½A 
ih0,l0;w0ih0&,0ih0 69 lk0 fo/kk;h&2022&¼935½&300 izfr;ka&¼dEI;wVj@Vh0@vkWQlsV½A 


