HH-IEIT—137 IREIE TFRR—THoTHoUTo / Telo

S0 / ToUlo—91 / 2014—16
AT T URE UT H-Hed ¢

RERT TAC, IO Ha9T

SR W29l W R W TR

1k i, I
faemrdl aRfRrse

HAT-3, Evs (P)
(SR U<¥ faud Aved & fagas)

A9G®, HITdR, 26 3N, 2025
HiqgUc 4, 1947 Wb JHq

oo war afrarea

= 1829 / fa0%0 /A< / 73(%)-2025
TGS, 14 3WTE, 2025

SIBRCEIl
garof

IR U 1Y AU Avsel Aawy d /3l gE-giaem fafdr (@enes) R, 2025, @
IR U< I 991 & e 13 37T, 2025 ¥ fa7i 14 3T, 2025 TP IaRd ool IUAYH H
QI 14 ST, 2025 B QRIAMUT [HAT T, IR U< [AuM @91 @7 ufehar qn sRi—wdre
framraet, 2023 & 99 126 @ I UAGERT USRI fhar SIrdm & |

IR Yo oy AU qUSe A de 3l gu-gfaer fafe
(o) faers, 2025
SR U I fAuE Aved (Wewii @l Sudferlt @ik uvE) arfdfrem,

1980 MR IR WY FHA (O, Wl MR Farof Sugw) AfATH, 1981 & RAR
[T R & forg
faerr®s

IRA ORI & fogaRd a¥ # Udggnr FfeRed srfafm a=mn
STl &

JEYI—Uh
IR
1—(1) JB AWM IR U9 T AU Aved He qur HAl W&\W T 3R
gE@—gfaer fafer (Frer) s, 2025 H81 S |
(2) 7% faTid 01 oI, 2025 | Uged 3N FASI SIRAT |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e




2 IR UQYT IMRIRYT TSI, 26 3T, 2025
AT
SR USY g g Aved (el &) SudfRrf iR Uer)
rfarfr, 1980 &1 R
IR yeTT 2—(1) SR Uw Ty "vesd (el @ Syl iR )
s e e 1980 ROTY SMRT &1 1ff e w'r T B, @ Ry 3 H,
23 W9 1980 @ (@) SUIRT (1) § ¥g Uil §olR 90" & I R g T
;ﬂjﬁa:m IR WU ¥ &3 SIRAT |
(@) SUIRT (2) & gwar FfaRad SUaRT ggr <1 SRR, srerfd—
") WeR & dad H faAd 01 3Wid, 2025 W YR EAR YD 05
99 & YA AMIHR AR, 1961 QAW Awar 43 A9 1961) D GRT 48 &
WG & @GUs (Ufd) & el IuERd ANTd IERWIT gad & AER W gy
@1 SR |
HIRT 4 BT 39l SIAFIH B ORI 4 ¥, TR UAN BOR BRI D WM R S
e " JUETR BOR ©UY" ¥ fad SR |
gRT 5 BT 4— S ARTH BT gRT 5 H-
N (@) SUIRT (1) # ¥ IR o9 U= 89 Sl & I W
I U A W I 3 SR |
(@) SUERT (2) #,
(T®H) T’ TP G B B WM TR G “TH oG Gad gl
SR I Y SR |
@) SUURT 2 & Yo WRd & @Us (W) § ¥ “Uedd BOlR
IR D W R R IEDH gRT G TR IR 3G & SR |
(1) SR 2 & agd WP H T “UAN FOR WO B AN
W € “TH g ®U” 79 3 SIRAT |
8T 10 1 5~ AT @ aRT 10 @ WE W Efaad o/ @ & SR,
RNIEE] 3rerfa—
“(10) 9 AT B AFAH Al FER AT OYd WE Bl SR B
T YT HUF O sl & forw w8 &R uxd S1igeh old gue afua
B U A 9 eanafta wx fear SR o fe kg fear S oden W
I Yed BT & Hod b TG AR VA Fe 1Al aYd 9aw Bl
e fear S |
EIRT 15 T 6—cl IMAFRH B &RT 15 H—
GNICE]

(@) SUIRT (1) ¥ o8 "I B9IR ®UI” & WH R & "3l IR
ufg | w0 g A SR |

(@) SUERT (1) & WRT 94 yd fF=foRed e g1 f&an
STRATT 3ferTd:—

] I8 & I @15 dew, ¥ a1 uRyg @l do& H genRerfa, e

T & SR Al Saal fedl afafa & R o # te T a1 S st
IuRerd &1 BT 8, @ 98 VY SRy & feaw & fow Swawr (i) & oA
3= e 9T PT BHaR TSI BT |

() SWIRT (2) & wIF R HfaRed SueRT @ < SRAfl, srerfa—

“(2) TS e, T8 98 R 2 & @vs (31) H fAfde faf ug ik

a7 fRef g1 @& 9T W A & A1 A7 &, S Al @ forw e kA 98 9=
AT & Bl Bg BT & 3R 58 foTg IuemRT () & sefi= 9 a1 s rguiis
TR 3 T 8 AT ALl 8 9ad B, &1 BuR W URifeT @1 R ¥ e

BT BhR BT

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



TR U IR TTole, 26 3R, 2025

(&) SUIRT (2) & uwdrq F=foiRad wRege del fear SR, sfeifd:

Ry I8 & dE N dew od H§ I9s UM @ @y B SHd
SHEA & fiF @& Rara Suawt (1) a1 (2) & i e AfFE WK & ghaR
&l B |

(S) SUURT (3) I Tt faam SR |

(@) SUURT (3) & yvarq fferRad SURT gaT <1 SR, ferfd—
“(4) SUERT (1) 3R (2) ¥ SfeatRaa fd wa # feAid 1 onid, 2025 &
UR™ BlAx UG Urd a¥ gvard ImueR AT, 1961 (iffm e 43 6
1961) B GRT 48 & WGV & WUs (€) & JFdF IURT AN GETDITT
IH B AR W g B REf |
7—ql AR B ORI 15—-F § TR I TR W, B WH W & GRT 15-F B
" A B S v R S| s
8—cl JMAFTTH B gRT 18—F # WS (&) # I8 AN TOIR ®R’, & ORI 18-F &
M W g, Yl 9R U 3@ A SR | W
9l SIAH BT arT 24 & W W FFEfAReT grT @ & SR, ar 24 @
STt — GNICE]
“(1) v afth e a1 a1 RS & e & ©U # fhdl +ff safr &
fov @ fvar 2, e Shaa-mid 3 goR w0 gfem & <R | deHE U
BT THER BII"
R I8 & Sl B afdd 7 qaikhIgaR Uh SRS, a8 SqD] Aafey
frar Y 81 A e Safy @ forw o fham &1 a1 98 v driea & IR
e f 99 & fU | F9R w0 IR @1 <R 9 SIS Yed Ui BT §HaR
BT

Ry I8 iR & &l fdt @fe 9 qafergar faus aRve & 95w @
U H UAT B Y BT UYUH PRIGIA oI BRI B, T8 A BOR U DI

aifaR<h 11 499 &1 8heR BN |

ITERU: A BOIR U HfHTE &1 fel Yer:

R I8 AR WY P e | & fques @ <en d g |@wr & faged
i & 0 fQum™ 91 @ Yo dod & i a® @ @Efy &l T 39 Hew
@ U yAIoHr & forg @1 SRRl S faafed faum | @1 stemer @ g 3R S
3rafyy & SR 31U Ug W 9 W2 B |

B STl fdl s 1 B A &R I 2Afdd @l 3@y & forg
Qa1 a1 9RYE & Ud 9 @ ®U H a1 &) 8 iR va a¥ gof L far
B a0 s @ U @) 0T & T g8 9 SRR f6 S @ A
UH 99 & foly 9a® & ©U ¥ SR 6T 7 |

(2) ST&T SUURT (1) & Srf9 U9 &7 §heR ®Is afn fhell o=y Uere
BT A THaR B, g8 oA AR U U @ IR SuuRT (1) @ i\ U
T &R BT EHAR BT |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



4 TR U IATIRIT oIS, 26 3T, 2025

(3) uP ARK BT A UM g faR<h UM H &A1® 01 3 2025 4
YR BIR IS Urd 99 TR DL AAFTIH, 1961 (RIS =T 43 A 1961)
D URT 48 & WEIHRY & @8 (UF) & 9 YR arTd qebIfa §ad &

MR W gfg & SRRM |
HRT 26— 10—l JATAFTIH BT IRT 26— H—
e (@) SUERT (1) & I W, FAfeRed SueRT 3@ <1 SR, srerfa—

“(1) e AT R W @I AU USEN & SR qg B S, dl
U AeR &1 ufd /ol a1 afe v @t dig ufd/aetl BredR) 9 9l S9d
aAD Fed A1 Afqared YRl Jog & GHI Fad FaRT Bl AT JAY UL
P R IT I B9IR B0 BT U, S A7 31fdd 81, U ufd /gl & Siadara
qP & U I JaaRd g=dl & gU%P, 81 AP AR YA & qHe H Il fdare
M T& YIRAIR®G UM U] &)+ & §HaR &I |

(@) SUIRT (2) & U9 IR frfeRad SUaRT g <) SIRAf, 3rerid—

“(0) Ife BN vod we & 4G 8 G, A1 V4 Ydgqd FE Bl
ufar /gl a7 Ife T @b dig Ui /Il Bled] A S A SHG aIRD qod
a1 Jfdarfed gRt, U YOqd WeR @ g & 99I B U b aRER AT A
BOIR w9 BT Yo, ST A1 o1fd 81, U ufd /usil @ Siaedld ddb & fofy
AU el B IURP 'MW AP IR IR b AES H SAP 9 BN a6
qRaReE UM U R & gHaR BT |

() faemm wRege & U fFrEfeiad WRege 9l faar SR srefia—

“IR<] I8 3R P TRl SUERT (1) AT (2) & 3= U o 3Med aafh verd
% THAR B Od © al U | fth I U FAM 3N # meRda e |-

JETI—AI
TR TS HAT (A9 T @R UHhIv Sugee) Srfef e 1981 &1 HeMers
SR T 11—-STR U< #WA (Ja9 W< SRyl Suewy ) oiffee 1981 @
3*2;'”“ “?%T ORI 3 # —
14 1981 . ) o . "
T 3 oy (@) SUERT (1) ¥ e AT TR ©IG° S W W e TN R
A w0 TG & SR |
(@) SUURT (2) # wreg I BOIR ®UY” & WIF W ¥ “YdTel™d g9
w0 TG A SR |
IELY 3R HRT

Y g Avsd a%ﬁqwl'aﬁagfsm o, Wi, YT 3R 3 gE—gfagradl qem #A &
aa I < Brel W YA e fhar WA €1 qed gl 3R Shad—aT Bl 9l T @ gied
U gRIET b S @1 fafree fbar ar € R 9 oo fafes & @7 dar defe WU | @R
b |

AR ARTIH, 1961 (IFAFTA =T 43 T 1961) DI GRT 48 & WEIGRV & @S (Ufa)
% S IUGT AN ERBIT Fad & AER R AR & Aegq I IS Ui 9y H Hd9g
™ & a9, «fFd AT T Y4 GEE Fedl DI U 3R AR UM Bl gARIfAT B B AR
WHR & A & gfera g8 fAfeed f&ar 71 & 6 SR uew 9 g wvsa (Fei @
SUafrdt iR der) Srfafram, 1980 3R STR U< HAY (I, W 3R Faof Iuew) rfSfaH, 1981
B FUMRT BRd T U Avsd & FaR & 94, <fd 1 T g4 g g Aved dewdl
BI UM, IR U @I fadie 01 ofid 2025 ¥ YA Ui a9 o= AT AT H giferd fpan o |

TeIR, IR U<¥ g e Aved wewy iR #3 gu—gfaen fafdy (Fenem), fagas, 2025
RIS far e 2 |

R FAR G
T3,
TR B |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



TR U IR TTole, 26 3R, 2025 5

SR _UeY I AU Aved e 9ol HA ge—yfaem fafy (), fate, 2025 &

T ¥ < smoa-u7 |

SR U¥ I I Aved waw dn /Al gE—gfawn fAfd (Fee), g, 2025 & wead
I TR U I AU Aved (AeR @) Sudferdt iR uvH) ifdfaH, 1980 @ €RT 3, 4, 5, 10,
15,15—, 18—, 24 d 26—P qAT SR U FHA (I, <1 MR Tl Suewr) srfarfzs, 1981 @
gRT 3 BT AT frar S & o I @ dfad [AfS o ot ®o 1,05,21,63,000 (Td 3Rd U=

PRIS FIDIE AIRI IRAS BOIR WU ATH) BT JFAIT Al ATaTd - AR SHTUK & |

R FAR G
3

< BT |

IR TSI S AU Avse ey Tl Hal gg—faen fafey () (fead, 2025 gRT

IR B S drell gl SR &1 Wd SR &l Sgx |

TR U< Y fAu™ Aved (el & Sudferl iR ueH) 1farf=aH, 1980

g7 3(1)

T 4

gRT 5

(1) I & Far ke o 9 =, U Ae S1UHl ASIdT @) Jrafey
B o =i &R 9Y YT BT I 919 BT §HaR 8T |

[T A1 URYE & IS 9, Il 98 9N 2 & @re (3) H fAfde
e Ug TR SR BT AT 9 B, U ST @ Ay H Ua g9iR By ufa
AT b1 fyafed &= 91 UM BT haR BN |

R Ig b gafh 9aw, A8 e, 2020 ¥ AIE, 2021 TH AR
BT ATF TR URA9d & foy ghaR B |

(1) 39 JAFH & Iudsl & 9 I8 gY, A9l AT URYg B UAD
A P, ﬂﬁﬂngzﬁw()ﬁﬁﬂﬂqﬁwsﬂﬁ?ﬁm:@ 3R 01
ST 2015 9 IR ARG Yo B9 Afad & Sfd qeI & ed b ol

3R

IR I S AR AT d1e) I B forg W gl & gaR, off fafea &y
SR, SYANT # ™ S Al 2 |
(2) 9 fRM & = IuFEl & IFfF B gU, UAD Y SEl

ford STATT # A S Wb & SR §9 SUIRN & Sl A T Yot U w
SUIRT (1) & UG oI SIERDEY qRac=T dfed @R 81 |

g
QA A arel X HuAl § 9 S f[Adhed R Ia ed b VA U B qoll,
o a8 =m—

(@) T Hod & HUF AT AR B afgid IR gew & AiaR a1 9w
ol 7T argaT gIRT AT & ford 99 & SIRAT iR

(@) Saa ol ared & for Ugia a1 S Bg U=di g9k 3ud Ui
HIE I NS DT GFRIRT Tba YA DI SIRAT |

Ry I8 IR fF o9 o f arag@ford geeR & ol faR ¥ gfg
ENfl, TS0 WRER AT Q¥ §RT N HUH @ ed H SMgufad gfg aR
GERIES

W] I§ SR P B qaUYd e B IUERT (2) & 3 A o
qrel X AT H W BN N G agIE g A R B fol IS Ao
TR T oI & Hud 37 TRAT |

(2) g I 1 & (1 vagd Aew &1 IAD! QI T arel Nl Huel
43 I9b (ol ared @ ol Ui a1 SI9d 8 UA B9R U § JFe®
DI AP FRI B T YA AT SIRAT |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



6 TR U IATIRIT oIS, 26 3T, 2025

HRT 10 9 AN B T WM fHar T X guE N ey @ fou At
BINT, 3R T JAUG<h U Ared dl, Ul AfT I dler fear s o fafed @
I |

oIRT 15 (1) 9% HEW AR 98 ORT 2 @ @oe (3) H ffde 5l 1v w amim

B AT 9 8 T FIR U ufafeT @ ) ¥ e 9w & gheRr Brm et
o ffolRad fRigial @ orgaR &1 Sirefl, serfa—

(T®) S W<, AR, F9T a1 URYg & 99 & AR, a1 SEd! ol
T & i SudeEl |, ude 9 @1 SuRefa & forr <o g m:

@) S W, IRl |9 a1 9RYg & AR SudYH & U& T 3@
IR U & ywanq & fog o <u 8rm afe |ewy, S Al § U9 oW aR Suded
B M R SR g,

() S W, gRufa, aw o uRvg & a1 S|l 9fRfd & fed
AR SYIYE & aRE RFE & &A1 & o, 8k U0 AR SuaeHl & da 3
S arell Bl & oAl & fofg o1 <¥ 8hm, Ife wed v ol oAl § SudeE &
I TR SR B

@R) SH WO IR ¥ 3G U feAl @ ford Wt <3 g S | A

=

uRyg @ a1 IS9P AT & A SudeE & off<d fod 3R ST a1 fsl 3=y
afafer & ar 991 a1 aRve & SUgTH & v o & 9 us, afe dew o ol
foi & SUdeHE & wIF R SuRerd gl

(gr=) STet @vs () a1 @vs (@R) & 3T 3 arell favil Reafd # &1

WS UM & W ¥ 30 a1 e fated 85 & el o, 98t
Ig, gRT 14 ¥ &0 919 & 8 gU A1, 9 9N & SUGHl & ATAR < Wl P,
T URT 14 B AR AEAG 2T BT, 379 9 W1 A 8. THIR S1TI;

[(are—e) Sth W<l fbel e @ fbel wffy @ Tt & wu d il
P 9ob I = ) Affd & e & IR ° f deES I W), IfT 39 ORT B
Pl o SUe & Sl IW PIs UAT 9T IUAT &I T8l 8, 9F BN, R PIg
U 91T U Pefrex AT H Af0d I e & IR M W AR Th IR & o
iftres & o1fdrs <1 fea & ford <3 &rm

(Ura—w) St w1 ORT 14 ® @us () ¥ ffde &l oo, AER A
reTTe UrgashH # SuRefa & ford i <7 g

(@ra—g™) 2[ XXX] (@) 7 X X X]

®) [XXX]

TEHRUT— 39 IRT & YAl & forv Bl SUded &l oRITdR aHe
ST A BN d8% @ off~ T ok T 9o & voM fid & I fa=i &
AT IR | Afdd T B

4(2) yAB T 9 faAt & forg +ff 9 98 Sar @ @At & forg ERT
PN SR e forg SuerT (1) & orfid w1 a1 oufie & o= 71 &1 a1 9 &
AHAT &1, S[TH BOR Uid Sl wU] UfIfes @ <X 9 e W &7 HaR BN |

(@) SueRT (1) § & WA R 919 @ B gU Al ORT 2 & @S (3) H
ffde Bl ug R IIF AW ok A1 fREN g & S9a argel driae H,
R a8 W U R i 2, uda fid @ forg o & wu ufafed o < &
< war <u Brm, R 89 Al & e for a8 Suawr (1) @ oA <fie
T BT STaT N |,

HRT 15— |/ 1 URYE & TH e d2 98 O 2 & 9vs (31) # fAfds faef
U WX IMAE & A1 7 7, ford Aar foRel ga o afefaa € e dewiar &
safr # a1, AR, o Wl FRidd #, R 98 8 U8 R i ©.
2 JedNT BOTR ©Ud] UMY & &) WX Afdi w-r UM BT §haR 8N (]

Suvg T8 & yath daw WE omd, 2020 W AT, 2021 ddb SUYH
AR I BT A1H IR e & o ghaR BRI ]

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



TR U IR TTole, 26 3R, 2025 7

HRT 18— |qAT AT URYE & IS HeW, 918 98 ORI 2 & @us (3) H Sfeaiiad
Pl T W T B W T8 W gl @ ogar, o fafka fad @,
f=ferRad T ghaR BT 3ffid—

(@) T WRBR GRT AU AT ARIET bl IRuarer A1 Nemerd § ger
DI S arell a8y fafdbed iRk gfaensll & gael § e sravia sAver o 8.
A EOIR PUY Ui & EeRIRT 1 fear ST

(@) U sRUdrdl H oo ford &R o uRaR & el & foR, e
AT H ffdear & fory Wil &_er Sufer B, Mryges o IR Rafeea dar

SYTE] hXIIT ST |

e 24 (1) v afed s a9 a1 IRYE & I @ ©U H fhdl Y safy &
o & fhar 81 e Siiad i U= g9k Uy UfadT @1 e} 3 UIE U
BT PSR BNIT:

R S8l R afdd 9 STIHGAR U 9y ¥ 3Afdd @ & foy s
foar 81, 98 98 e 9¥ 9 e ude Pf af & o Q1 TR wud ufomr &
R 9 AfaR® T UM BT FHIR BN

R I8 SR fF a9 91 g @ Reafd # fRum @1 & 57 89 &
fafsr 1 =0 fQue 991 & UM SUIYE dd @1 @ @l ITOET U e & UeH
yAHl & forg @ SIREfT S W fAeT AT @ etenet I8 81 SR 9w el @
SR 9 WU H AU U WX IMMHIA & |

WEHRU—oEl 6l @fth 7 991 a1 aRYg & 9 & w4 ¥ B: AE Al
A e fh] T a¥ 9§ HH q@W & foly s fhar & 98l 39 9N &
yare e I wHen e R 99 @t 7 e ¥ & folv 9e @ w9 H e
fBar 2|

(2) STEf SWIRT (1) & A U &I §HaR dis AfRh [l =T Yo &
fl PR B, 98f T @R U e & A1 SuERT (1) @ 3rfie dee ue
P THAR BIIT |

oRT 26—% (1) afs AewIar &1 IEfy & SRM ¥l T wew &1 uRaR® Jg &
TG, A1 Jog & FHY (adTTd e Bl ST AFHA U AT Y=l BOIR U Bl
e S M IS B @ wiRaiRe YoM &1 Uar ufd/uel emoilad ghaR 'l
SR |

(2) It Oy wew, B T B O™, A GG B 9T U Y4 AS P
U A7 ¥U TN gOIR @l UeE S A1 31fde & @ uiRaiRe Uee &1 U
9fY /Ul JIToNaT §HER BT SIRAT:

o] I8 b afe afd /uet a1 3 & Sreid I+ srerar gRT 24 @ [UERT (1) &
e foedl 4o &7 EHhaR &1, df 98 SULRT (1) A7 SYRT (2) & 3rid
qRAR® UM &I THER &l BRI |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e




8 TR U IATIRIT oIS, 26 3T, 2025

TR U HAl (I, A< SiR UahIvl Suee) IffSf~rad, 1981

oY 3 (1) g=m =30, us w4, I HA (WEA Y9R) SR o HAT SfUel y_Tae H
JMENUT ATl 89TR HUY U AT & - & EhaR BT
T~ I% & @ 74, uQdd w4, I w9 (WdA 9NR) SR ISy HAl, A8
IS, 2020 & AIE A, 2021 TH URT ATE A<F dad, fatam &5 w1 qen afedg s
BT AH IR Afed & oY gdheR 8|
2) vA% Ta H#A U UeEfy | emear 4 g9R wud Ui A & dad
P BHAR BT |

3T N,
TEg HAR T,
UqQ A |

UTTAR PRADESH SARKAR
SANSADIYA KARYA ANUBHAG-1

No. 195/XC-S-1-25-08S-2025
Dated Lucknow, August 26, 2025

NOTIFICATION
MISCELLANEOUS

IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is
pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the "Uttar Pradesh Rajya Vidhan
Mandal Sadasya Tatha Mantri Sukh-Suvidha Vidhi (Sanshodhan) Vidheyak, 2025" introduced in the Uttar
Pradesh Legislative Assembly on August 13, 2025.

THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE MEMBERS AND MINISTERS
AMENITIES LAWS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2025
A
BILL

further to amend the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments
and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981

IT IS HEREBY enacted in the Seventy-sixth Year of Republic of India as

follows:-
CHAPTER- 1
PRELIMINARY
Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature Members and

commencement Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2025.
(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1 day of April, 2025.
CHAPTER-II

AMENDMENT OF THE UTTAR PRADESH STATE LEGISLATURE (MEMBERS'
EMOLUMENTS AND PENSION) ACT, 1980
Amendment of

Section 3 of U.P. 2. (1) In the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature (Members' Emoluments and
ActNo.23 of 1980  Pension) Act, 1980, hereinafter referred to as the principal Act, in Section 3,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "twenty five thousand rupees", the
words "thirty five thousand rupees" shall be substituted,

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



TR U IR TTole, 26 3R, 2025

"(3) The salary of members shall be increased after every five years
commencing from 1% April, 2025 on the basis of Cost Inflation Index provided
under clause (v) of Explanation to Section 48 of the Income-tax Act, 1961
(Act No. 43 of 1961)."

3.In Section 4 of the principal Act, for the words "fifty thousand rupees" the
words "'seventy five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

4.In Section 5 of the principal Act,-

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "four lakh twenty five thousand
rupees", the words "five lakh rupees" shall be substituted,
(b) in sub-section (2),—

(i) for the words "one lakh rupees", the words "one lakh fifty thousand

rupees' shall be substituted,

(i) in clause (b) of first proviso, for the words "twenty five thousand
rupees', the words "the amount opted by him" shall be substituted;
(¢) in the fourth proviso, for the words "fifty thousand rupees", the
words "one lakh rupees' shall be substituted.
5.For Section 10 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
namely:-
"The railway coupons issued to a member or ex-member under this Chapter shall
be valid for such period and every unused coupon shall be surrendered to the
Secretary in such manner as may be prescribed and an amount equivalent to the
value of such surrendered railway coupons shall be paid in cash to such member
or ex-member."

6.In Section 15 of the principal Act,—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "two thousand rupees", the words

"two thousand and five hundred rupees" shall be substituted;

(b) before the Explanation to sub-section (1), the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely :-

Provided that if a member does not attend the sitting of Assembly or
Council, as the case may be, on a day or more during a session or at any sittings of
any Committee thereof, he shall not be entitled for the daily allowance admissible
under sub-section (2) for the days of such absence.

(c) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:-
"(2) Every member whether or not he holds any office referred to in
clause (i) of Section 2 and the Leader of Opposition shall be entitled to daily
allowance at the rate of two thousand rupees per day for the days during which he
tours for the works inthe s ervice of the public and for which the allowance or

incidental charges under sub-section (1) are not, may not be admissible.";

(d) after sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted,

namely:-

Provided that a member shall not be entitled to the daily allowance
admissible under sub-sections (1) or (2) for the period of his confinement in a jail
except the day of his discharge.

(e) sub-section (3) shall be omitted;
(f) after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely:-

"(4) The daily allowances mentioned in sub-sections (1) and (2) shall be
increased after every five years commencing from 1% April, 2025 on the basis of
Cost Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of Explanation to Section 48 of the
Income-tax Act, 1961 (Act No.43 of 1961)."

7.In Section 15-A of the principal Act, for the words "twenty thousand rupees
", the words "thirty thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

8.In Section 18-A of the principal Act, in clause (a) for the words "thirty
thousand rupees", the words "forty five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e

Amendment of
Section 4

Amendment of
Section 5

Amendment of
Section 10

Amendment of
Section 15

Amendment of
Section 15- A

Amendment of
Section 18- A



10

TR U IR oIS, 26 W, 2025

Amendment of

Section 24

Amendment of

Section 26-A

9.For Section 24 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted,
namely;—

"(1) Every person who has served as a member of the Assembly or the Council
for any period shall be entitled to a pension at the rate of thirty five thousand rupees

per month throughout his life:

Provided that where any person who has served as aforesaid for a period
exceeding one term of whatever duration, he shall be entitled to an additional
pension at the rate of two thousand rupees for every completed year in excess of

one term:”

Provided further that where any person who has served as aforesaid for
his first full term of six years as a member of Council, he shall be entitled to an
additional pension of two thousand rupees ie. a total pension of thirty seven

thousand rupees per month:

Provided also that in the event of dissolution of Assembly, the period from the
date of dissolution of Assembly, till the date of first meeting of the new Assembly,
shall be counted for pension purposes of a member who has been the speaker of the

dissolved Assembly and has continued to be in office as such during the said period.

Explanation- Where a person has served as a member of the Assembly or the
Council for a term of six months and above and has not completed one year then such
person shall for the purposes of calculating the pension, be deemed to have served as

member for one year.

(2) Where any person entitled to pension under sub-section (1) is also entitled to
any other pension, such person shall be entitled to receive the pension under sub-
section (1) in addition to such pension.

(3) The pension and additional pension to every person shall be increased
after every five years commencing from 1% April, 2025 on the basis of Cost
Inflation Index provided under clause (v) of Explanation to section 48 of the

Income-tax Act, 1961 (Act No.43 of 1961)."

10.In Section 26-A of the principal Act,—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,

namely:-

“(1) If a sitting member dies during the tenure of his or her office, the spouse of
such member or if such person leaves no spouse, his minor children or unmarried
daughters shall be entitled to a family pension equal to pension otherwise admissible
to the deceased member at the time of death or a pension of thirty thousand rupees,
whichever is greater, for the lifetime of such spouse or till the minor children attain

the age of majority and in case of daughters till they get married.”;

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



TR U IR TTole, 26 3R, 2025 11

(b) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(2) If an ex-member dies, the spouse of such ex-member or if such person leaves
no spouse his minor children or unmarried daughters shall be entitled to a family
pension equal to pension of such ex-member at the time of death or a pension of thirty
thousand rupees, whichever is greater, for the life-time of such spouse or till the minor

children attain the age of majority and in case of daughters till they get married.”
(c) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

"Provided further that where more than one person becomes entitled for
pension under sub-sections (1) or (2) all such persons shall draw the said pension in

equal shares."

CHAPTER-1III
THE UTTAR PRADESH MINISTERS (SALARIES, ALLOWANCES
AND MISCELLANEOUS PROVISIONS) ACT, 1981

I1. In Section 3 of the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and  Amendment of

Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981,— [Sjelcltl(;nt 3 10:
T ACTtno

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words '"forty thousand" the words "Fifty or1981
thousand" shall be substituted,

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "thirty five thousand", the words "forty
five thousand" shall be substituted.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The salary, allowances, pension and other amenities admissible to the members of the State
Legislature and the salary of Ministers have not been revised for a long time. In view of the price rise and
escalation in cost of living, it has been decided to revise the same so that they may serve the cause of their
constituency in a meaningful manner.

In view of the decision by Government of India to revise the salary, daily allowance of members
of Parliament, pension and additional pension of ex-members of Parliament every five years through
notification on the basis of cost inflation indexprovided under clause (v) of explanationto Section 48 of the
Income-tax Act, 1961 ( Act No.43 of 1961), it has been decided to revise the salary, daily allowance of
members of State Legislature and pension, additional pension of ex-members of State Legislature every
five years in the same manner from 1% April, 2025 by amending the Uttar Pradesh State Legislature
(Members' Emoluments and Pension) Act, 1980 and the Uttar Pradesh Ministers (Salaries, Allowances and
Miscellaneous Provisions) Act, 1981.

The Uttar Pradesh State Legislature Members and Ministers Amenities Laws (Amendment)
Act, 2025 is introduced accordingly.

SURESH KUMAR KHANNA
Mantri,
Sansadiya Karya.

By order,
J. P. SINGH-II,
Pramukh Sachiv.

GoTHOOT0—T0UI0 147 TSTUF—2025—(446)—599+25+5-629 Uferani (Slociodo / ATHT) |

147 RPH (Members & Ministers Amenities Laws) (Sansadiya) 2025 Data 4e



