Y GEIT—71 Goflexur WAT—UA/DO/DDN/30/2024-2026

yu/c GG IS

IARNEUS ARDBIR gIRT Yh1idrd

SIITENNT]

faurfl aRRrse

T2, Evs (P)
(STRIEVE  IUATIYN)

QBNGH, YHAR, 25 SIS, 2025 30

SITACT 03, 1947 IH |

IIREITS A
faemrft v e ol faunr

AT 259 / XXX VI (3) /2025 /36(1) / 2025
QBYIGA, 25 Gals, 2025

e
fafaer

“IRE BT AT B AT 213 @ WU (1) B 3ef qo SIS T HAH
IR W, SwRrEves (HeeE) swarey, 2025 wenfid fear & ek 9w
STRTEVS 5T DT AT WA 03 q¥—2025 & WY § AR & e
¥ JAMRRTET g7 Wt faar S &



2 STRTEYS IMIEROT TG, 25 TS, 2025 $0 (STAT 03, 1947 ¥ T

A RS Wfedl, STRREvS (W) ey, 2025
(STRTETS grearesr wea— 03, a9 2025)
(mwmmwa%%?aﬁaq‘ﬁwmammmﬁﬁ)

WA ARG Wled], STRIEve, 2024 (@RIPRE We—o3 qs, 2024) ¥

IR FOEH &R B forg

JreYTS 9T

| fs, 5T o AU W W= A A€ § o) vouarel @ aw W 8 T R
- B ol oRReftl e & R @ T QT BNATE BNAl STASIF g

T 8

STIQ, 19, I57UTel MRT @ WA & IeeT 213 @ WU (1) BRI Uewd
STl @1 warT e gu FrefiRad sy wemiie e

G A ailv
TN

8T 7 BT GEE

RT 10 BT G

HRT 11 6T GIEH

(O8]

(1) =0 sy o1 e ww @ AR
e, SRS (L) e, 2025 2 |

(2) uE R~ g B

WA ARG wfedr Sanwgvs, 2024 (R et
AT el WfRAr weT war 8) @ wwr 7 o9
SUERT (1) @ fgdiy e # v Aw uwt @
WIF W e " wreg ¥ f{F S |

ol fgar H, gy 10 §—

(1) SURT (2) 4, B8 "' &l & e w
Th i wer /g o S

(i) SUaRT (3) ¥ 'wg W el & WM W
TP g oo W &y SR |

el e W, 4R 11 #—

(i) S®mT (3) 8 B8 7E vl B WA W
TP Y e W e S,

(i) SUIRT (1) ¥ 'B% W% w=l & WE W
T 94 e R & SR |

o o e R,
drdigeey, gargewgy,
vdeaeE, figaer @ )
XTSqYTel, SRIETS |

JATST 9,

g agdal,
yq@ afaq |



STRTEVE IRATENRY] ToIC, 25 ST, 2025 30 (STA0T 03, 1947 ¥H ¥ 3

No. 259/XXXV1(3)/2025/36(1)/2025
Dated Dehradun, July 25, 2025

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous

In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3) of Article 348 of the
Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English translation of ‘The - Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand

(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025' (Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 03 of 2025).

As promulgated by the Governor on 24 July, 2025.

The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025
[Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 03 Year, 2025]

(Promulgated by the Governor in the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic of India)
An
Ordinance

further to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of the
year, 2024), "

Whereas, the Legislative Assembly of the State is not in session and the Governor "
is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of -
the Constitution of India, the Govemror is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinances:- ‘

Short title and 1. (1) This Ordinance may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
commencement Uttarakhand (Amendment() Ordinance, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.
Amendment of 2. In section 7 of the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024
section 7 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Code). in the sccond
proviso to the sub-section (1), for the words 'six months', the
words 'one year' shall be substituted.



STRIEVS IATERYT TSI, 25 G[allg, 2025 30 (STAUT 03, 1947 b GH)

Amendment of

section 10

Amendment of
section 11

3.

4,

In the principal Code, in section 10,-

(1) in sub-section (2), for the words ‘six months®, the words
'one year' shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words ‘six months’, the words
'one year' shall be substituted.
In the principal Code, in section 11,-

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words ‘six months’, the words
‘one year' shall be substituted:;

(i1) in sub-section (4), for the words ‘six months’, the words
‘one year' shall be substituted.

LT GEN GURMIT SINGH,
PVSM, UYSM, AVSM, VSM (Retd)
Governor, Uttarakhand.

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATURVEDI,
Principal Secretary.

Hlogvoo (arRogo) 17 / faurft / 330—2025—1004-500 uferaf (Prgex /Aferar)



