SearETe ey e e (Teal o Sqefp el Jem) (W) fdaw, 2025
(Sexrgvs fadms €&t ... T 2025)

SeRTETE Sd T W (FEel @ Suefer aie o) orfifrgw, 2008, W UK

e R B oY
ICEREY
Wmﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁmﬂ?ﬂmﬁ—ﬂmmﬁﬂﬁ’%ﬂﬁ%muw

Bl

e am W | (1)w@ﬁﬁaﬁmﬁﬁwmmqm@3mﬁww(ﬂaﬁ

YR & Sraftn dv Yo (GeRmE) SR, 2025 =

(2) g% o1 S 2020 S GG BT WAL S
R & &1 5 SNETS oY [GRTE Hl (@Hqﬁiﬁeqﬁ%ﬂiaﬁqﬁsﬁ
e aﬂérﬁ'aﬁ,zooa,(ﬁﬁu@fmrﬁ@ﬁﬁwww‘é},aﬁwsﬁ,—

@) ST (1) § fefefEn g et v far o, sl
memﬂmaﬂ‘%ﬂﬁﬁﬁ?ﬁﬁmm

TR 9 ¥ ¥ X O B ST @ I IR RN THE W FH

() SN () -

(@) ﬁ*«wﬁaswﬁw@ammmwmﬁﬂ

\ma';
| (@) e g T W e e 7=} @ WM R AW TR TR
() N FER TR @ A R "yesTS FAR U ¥ &l 9,
(v) e e @ T PR WP siFerfiE X faar Wi,
CHIGE

'mﬁagﬁﬁﬁaum@‘[maéa%eiﬁﬁwaa@mﬁmﬁf
@EFE’HE—W"*@{-&@WFJH?EWTT%W&WHW
N 15 BT 3. nﬁ&ﬁﬁwﬁ—aﬁﬁ5zﬁw¢iwﬁmﬁ{ﬁquﬁﬁwﬁa
HeE R &) ), sl
“15.??1%@@@%?@%@,ar%*a—s*wza%w(a)ﬁﬁ%a
iwwmaﬁqe‘rmw’nma‘?waﬁmzﬁmﬁwweﬁzﬁﬂ
mw¢m7wwmwﬁm%m&ﬁqm@ﬁﬁéaﬁ
B R TR WE &

(- e

= LGRS

T
STCH S




J W T & & Fr 91 ey g6 98 @ 9T AR e o]
| ‘ Y 3T S Bl
| |

| STRT 20 1 a. jﬁ@ﬁﬁaﬁaﬁwzo#n
| S '-(EJ ST (1) R R SN e S T W s s v

@ o S

(i) o v 4 "2 euR 4 W e v B U W BoR T




STRTETS fAeTT w41 & #lo Fawi vd A0 gegd wawlt /qod Rumaet a
He iR UeE e o glemel s @ e Sekavs e an
qo IR W wET v Fae &, J9r wel W AR e ¥ awmie GES]
AT (2023—2024) (Fo R a1 ¥ o9 wem ufpes 3 e /g B A
R A v Wl A it @ frarwm 3 SRS e Qe a
(ol @ SueRmr sk YvE) e 2008 (SeRrEvs afafNug e os,
ag— 2008) H HeMuH fbar ST TRaTRE
2~ vl fdae Swi Seiv A R e 3




The Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and
Pension) (Amendment) Bill, 2025
(Uttarakhand Biil No. ...... of 2025)
A
Biil
further to amend the Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly (Members’® Emoluments

and Pension) Act, 2008,
It is hereby enacted by the Uttarakhand State Legislature in the Seventy-sixth year of the
Republic of India as follows:-

Short title and 1. ’(1) This Act may be called the Uttarakhand State Legislative
Commencement | Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and Peusion) {Amendment)
| Act, 2025.
( (2) it shall be deemed to have come into force from Aprii 01, 2022,
| |
Amendment of 2. i In section 5 of the Uttarakhand State Legislative Assembly
sectiop 5§ (Members’ Emoluments and Pension) Act, 2008, (hereinafter referred

to as principal Act), -

' §}] in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-
“Provided that at the end of the year every member of
the Assembly shall be entitled to receive balance amount in
[ cash out of the amount of railway coupon amounting forty
/ thousand rupees after availing the railway coupon.”
|
|

(i) in sub-section (2),-

() for the words “three lac”, the words “three lac forty
thousand” shall be substituted.

(b) for the words “twenty two thousand five hundred
rupees per month”, the words “twenty six thousand
rupees per month” shall be substituted,

(c) for the words “thirty thousand”, the words “twenty eight
thousand” shall be substituted.

(d) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Provided also that at the end of the year ex-member
| shall be entitied to receive balance amount in cash out of
) —

g‘a‘;{ﬁ'ﬁ'\'ﬁ Wid

e T ST
Kia CIPELES




the amount of railway coupon amounting twenty cight
thousand rupees after availing the railway coupon.”

_Amendmeut of 3.
section 15

For section 15 of the princi'pal Act, the following section shall be |
substituted; namely-

“15. The State Government may provide for grant of a advance loan,
not exceeding rupees twenty five lac at the applicable interest rate of
GPF, for any purpose, to any member whether or not he holds any
office referred to in clause (f) of section 2, or has held any office as
member of House which includes Leader of Opposition:

Provided that the amount of advance loan shall be repaid in equal
monthly instalments of ten years.”

_Améndment of 4.
section 20 _

L

[n section 20 of the principal Act-

(i) in sub section (1), for the words “forty thousand rupecs” the
words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

(i) in the first proviso, for the words “two thousand five hundred
rupees” the words “three thousand rupces” shall be substituted. |

S e -

L)
: T S
S T ARG AD




Statement of Objects and Reasons

The Ad hoc committee concerning the House, constituency,
service conditions etc., of Hon’ble members’of Uttarakhand Legislative
Assembly (2023-2024) (Fifth Legislative Assembly), in it’s first report,
has recommended to revise the pension, additional pension and other
facilities etc, of the Hon’ble members and ex-members of Uttarakhand
Legislative Assembly. To implement the recommendation of the
committee, it is proposed to amend ‘The Uttarakhand State Legislative
Assembly (Members’ Emoluments and Pension) Act, 2008°.

2-  The proposed Bill fulfills the above objective.

Prem Chand Aggarwal
Minister



