9 AR Wfdr, ScREvs (HeeE) fduas, 2025
Sarrave fUue |- ay 2025}
THT ATRE TR, SERNEvS, 2024 (IR W03 AW, 2024) H HET
o B forg,
fadrae

TR RIS @ foEaRd ¥ § SaRave RuH-ded g1 Fefafad wu #
Tz fRfrafa 8-

vt =W R L (1) == sffrEw & W 9 wEE AERe e,

AR IcREve (FeeE) JrfEfEH, 2025 |
(2) T TR=T ¥ged B8IIT |
wfear @1 gemeE 2. G TRE Witar Sanr@vs, 2024 (O TET

M He wfRdr dE1 T R) H qus ufhar wfed
1973 (TR W@ 02 9§ 1974) W, Id, U=
Td PISH & WF W, JTa—oTal 98 3fd 8 AR
aeRe |ren wfedr, 2023 (affm | 46, T
2023) W, 3, IR Td Frod @ {4 o |

ORI 7 & OO 3. el wfeer @1 g7 7 #, SR (1) @ fecid aRege
§ ‘B WE YRl ® WM W e a¥ ¥k 9 e
SR |

ORI 10 & WeNEM 4. o Gfedl H, ¥R 10 H-

(i) SR (2) # B A6 UK D WH W TP
q¥’ T ¥ fad SR,
(i) SR (3) # 'BE " R b WK R T
Y vreg X o SR |
ORT 11 @7 WA 5. ¥l §fedr H, gR 11 -
(i) STRT (3) # BT WE 9= b WF R U@
Y vreg w9 oy SR,
(i) SR (4) ¥ BT TR YRl & ®WH W T
Ty vrer w9 58 SR |



Iw

gRT 12 &7 G9EE 6.

gRT 17 &1 §MuE 7.

oRT 19 &T GIuA 8.

49 9RT 19% BT 9.
=R

ORT 24 BT "dMEH 10,

@#%mefnﬁamuaﬁm(ﬂﬁ,vﬁm‘wa‘i
R W) AR AR e @ el Sie |

ol TRaT @GR 17 B SWR (2) # “tF Alg dD
® PREAN I T gOR YA b B ARG Al
A B TR FH AWSN BN TR B WH W
TRA =T fedn, 2023 (A . 45, a9 2023)
& ITER VS BT ABN BT WK, ww=, R,
3R Brod W el S|

qel dfear @1 T 19 #, e H SUS AR @ AT
R IR’ v X9 A SR |

oo HfeaT B ORT 19 & URET T4 U 19%. B
Y § fread siaveia Br & oA, Fiq—

"19. w—ﬁaﬂmwwﬁaaﬁﬁwzﬁﬁm
JTel—

(1) wel o= 19 & ofia Su-feud o wiRd
aftRfe fear T @, @ @8 O fRad & iR
Uog RGN GRIT R F&WGWUWJ@TE%
HHe TS U PR FBIT|

(2) ST (1) & affa @ TE endie, R Mew
& it iy & e, fafta wu 4 ufear 7 wega
# oeh, SR v weR gN fAwiRa e
TAT B |

(3) arfieia TR, MaHATHR, A AR B
gfte, SurRoT A1 FPRE @ FE |

Ao wfedr BT R 24 B STRT (1) H—

(i) @ve (@) & | RrFg & WF W 7, AT AR SR
forg @ el oI;

(i) @vs (8) & year U@ =41 Wrs (§) frad
3T BY fear S, sfefia—

“(©) fr o & wwa R & B0 0@ TEaR |
IO TEEE @ fawa # fhemr wfaexor fear '



IRT 25 T LT

ORT 26 &1 GINEH

gRT 32 BT FIEH

SRT 43 BT GINEH

03

12.

13.

14.

H@ﬁ%ﬁﬁwzsﬁm(z)ﬁmmaﬁ
foreraq witrenia fpar ST, Ui

“(1) g A, faE @ HUTeH /3dd @ ULl
W,q@'w,wﬁma{wwﬂgﬂﬁm
FrHx U e fhar Bl |

g@ﬂﬁwﬁwzeﬁ’m(z)zﬁm(i)aﬂif
(i) & TeETq el SUEN (3) & W () MR (i)
- ofp, BSF AR o faxenfud X &
SR |
qﬁﬁ%ﬁaﬁwszﬁw(ﬂa%m(iii)zﬁ
qeaTd @ve (v), (v), (vi) T@ (vii) Frad sfaenfis
v & o, i
”(iv)aﬁT4EB?§E(iii)EﬂWEﬁ?ﬁaﬁaﬂﬂT
3 q sudl U8 Hd A faae wfeve sfefe,
2006 (SRIFRM T 6, ¥ 2007) B AT TS
B,
(v)ﬁww%muﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂ%'.ﬂ%mﬁiwﬁﬂzﬁ
qeETd U 4 @ @S () BT Secigd $d gy fHe
o ¥ faare @A &, O 98 R =g Hfe,
2023 (fFram ww@ar 45, A 2023) @ Jid <0
WW@W,

(\ri)aa,aamma’@a@a‘iwﬁﬁmmﬁ
fare @ fov Qedly W@ @XaT ®, 98 @i 99 J@
& FRER AR AN B U BT AR B
(vii)ﬁﬂ!%%%ﬂaqﬁmﬂ,ﬁﬂrf%?ﬁﬁaﬁm‘r
fourT 2 a1 T SHHR) <dl 8, df SAP1 T8 T
TRAG =g wafedn, 2023 (@fefaw w45, qy
2023) & AT TUSHIA B |
aﬁﬁ%mzﬁwmﬁmﬂ(ﬂﬁ,@?(ﬂ)%
g # e aggaR U9 oAy & STE
aRe T Il B W W e @ve (@),
(@)W(ﬂ)zﬁ'mﬂ?ﬂﬂsﬁmm"m
3R pree wg G SR |



gRT 384 T GINEH 15.

YRT 385 T HINEA 16.

gRT 387 T GINEHA 17.

qo wfdar @ oRr 384 H oW dArad & U
foretae e ST TG, S

Y A H, Fdgs AT wRRl @I, I TR
=Rl FuifRa uua 8, G- Hey wEw g d
THATO—U SIRI ST |

ool iR @1 GRT 385 H—

() SwuRr (1) ¥ U9 weaRl wredl P WM W
(i) STUIRT (2) @1 @9 @x e S,

(i) STERT (@) ¥, V9 WEaRl UKl B W W
39 TEaIrE’ v X9 fad e |

Hﬁ?ﬂ%ﬂaﬁmaa?ﬁ_mﬂ@)zﬁm
IR (4), (),(G)Q‘ciqwm(?)ﬁﬂaﬁﬁmﬁ
SITG, 3rerid—

“(4) Tfe dIg &ARP 9, aammaﬁmaﬁmﬁﬂfr
ZRp &1 GEAM UTd PR GE—ard Gay WA SRl
2 ) a8 orEN, el eEf wi ad 96§
FHdl 2 afda i SR 3R HM @1 W AT
BT |

(s)a‘rztﬁéﬂﬂwaao(z)zﬁ'wa'*aﬂﬁﬂ?~wﬁ
TAT L SY 9 98 9% @ ORE™ ¥ & $d (&G
SIRAT qel SEATT @1 1 9 8.

W%W@ﬁ#ﬁmﬁﬁwmﬂﬁ
SrT o SE—a ded & W PR fear
aprar forge @l @1 O 9y a1 Suw e iy
J ®Ig gar | 8|

()mﬁzﬁéwﬁﬁmqﬁaﬁﬁa@aﬁﬁﬁﬁw
Rpu T um S99 9w EM aren @ fafde
R, aft @ B, & f wu 9§ e feu
T wE—ara (Fre—ga Rergfim) Fdy # & &,
a8 VRAE = |fedr @ uN 82 @ i <fed
fopar SIRIATT:



TJAM ORI IR,

390% Ud 390W &I
3= RIT9H

free afik amgfed 19.

g afe gdadlt wE—amw dey & ARl 6|
af I7 IO e Al W IURYT AT AU B,
qr U e B AT FE-ad HeW Uoipa bR DI
A € ST HH |
(7) S PI$ fh URT 380 B IUYRI (3) b Ieeio
¥ a9 Hey § Edl B, 98 B AN dBb D
AIRYT FRIETE 3R o g9R a® BT A 3R

SEET 9 < TR SfaRe drE, St T AN ad
farecRer fepar o1 \ebar 8, TU8 1 |l 8N |7 |

uol Wf3ar @ URT 390 @ TN g NI 390% Ud
390% fAaq aia-Ifad &) & SR, aia—
"390%. GolihRol o YA &1 fda—

fIare. doit, HE—aid YTl ITWeR § HelRd

Rl gofipRor @) FRed v @ TRh ORT 12 B
st g RRER F=Ret BT Bl |
"390%. TR B IEeil—

oiRd, YOG & FH D) Wifd AT g6 i
& o 9w v el g fafafde ofem @
AR Il fopar SwgET | |

(1) " ArRe  wfed,  ScEvs (W)
JEITSRT, 2025 (LAY WEA-03 dY, 2025)
Taggr R fear o 2|

(2) U fREA @ B §U M1 9 AR & A
H T PE dd T pRAE 39 G B
TR SUdsll @ i @Y T gHSA S |



FoTd TG BRUI BT HUT

T AR wfRdr, SOREvE, 2024 (ARFEE . 03, a9 2024) % Hade D
Wsﬂfﬁﬁhﬂﬁmﬁﬁﬂﬁm,ﬁﬁ?{%ﬂwﬁﬁmiﬁﬁﬁwﬁ%
SIS BT S Y R Y Rl & O WaHE H FET FARas g T
B |
wﬁmﬁﬁmwa@ﬁ:ﬁﬂ%@ﬁwﬁaﬁqmﬁﬁ%—

. @Wmﬁﬁw—@maﬁﬁwﬁwwﬁm1

. ﬁaﬁ%ﬂﬂﬂww,ﬂ%—w(%a—sﬂﬁmﬂfﬁm)@w@zmﬁmﬁa
grETe @ At T ud ST e, ar g1 e JRgfeRer, TR SR
W,w,mmm@m@ﬂwﬁwmﬁﬁgﬂﬁﬁmwﬁ
IS SR ® WU H§ WA BT
-mqaésmﬁaﬁmﬁﬁﬂmﬁ%mzozsqﬁwﬁuﬂwﬁfﬁqym
wfedr, 2023 & JTHY AT DT | '

o SU_FETR WR < IRY @ A6g e Bl Alhar &1 Higur AT |

. WE_TTd WY TATE € TR TS W R Bl MG SN qR R
oot @ T H HoR &S Bl WIaHTT BT

o TT D IYc @l fAfr BT W JEHT BT

o I ARG iedn, STRETs (Wele) e, 2025 B FRRT BT

e e B W gl @ fRal @ ken dxa g¢ e ufkdr & garw w9 9
Tarfera fopar < 9 |

2— e RS Sad SRy BT wReer e 2, U SWidd Sqewdl @
gftt Far B |

XA



el s

1-%%%%?@&?%.3&1@@(%} s, 2025 @
siffyafa fvar s 2|

2~Wﬁlﬂ%ﬁwﬁﬁmﬁwﬁmﬁaﬂwmwﬁ%ﬁ%l

gspr s el
A



facig 9=
e REgE gRT @9 ATRe wiedn, Scxvs (eeE) ke, 2025 @
sfRfyafg fra s yxarfad 2 :
00— uedTg faerge ¥ wow @ G P @ g et @ eradt @y s 58
=

g g e
)



wuegaR fdaxont &1 3T

o e g wHH ATNTRS |fgdl, Sovgvs (HeEF) e, 2025 6

At e o uenfad 2 |

§

B =3 gy A o st

10.
11.
12.
13,
14.
13
16.
7
18.

19.

ATs @ w@ve 1§ ST @ Gfird A Ud UR™ &1 Suey fhar S
ydTfdd @ |

fasrre @ wue 2 ¥ wfdr &1 |eed fhar ST yRarfad © |

e & wWve 3 8 gl 7 @ FUEE fhar S gwdrfad 2 |
RAYus & WUe 4 A gRT 10 &1 YA far ST uRarfad & |

ST & WU 5 3 URT 11 B A fHar ST gRarfad @ |

s @ WU 6 § YR 12 &l WIEH fhar S gwanfad g |

e @ wWue 7 A gRT 17 1 |y fhar S yRarfad 2|
e @ @ve 8 § GRT 19 B WA fhar S yxarfad B |

fAvge © WUg 9 § 419 YURI 19% &I =<RATIH fhar SHr grfdd @ |
T @ @Ue 10 A URT 24 BT WA fHa1 SHT ywAmfad 2 |

RAYTE © WU 11 ¥ URT 25 BT e fhar S uRariad € |

fades & Wue 12 ¥ URT 26 B GIEA fhar ST geafad 2 |

e @ @vs 13 ¥ NI 32 B GEEE foar S uarfad @ |

e @ WUe 14 H URT 43 BT GRE fHI1 S URArfad 2 |

e & WU 15 H YR 384 b WA o ST wrfdd 2 |
s B WUue 16 § YUIRT 385 Bl G fhar S+ uxarfdd 2 |
e & WU 17 ¥ NI 387 &I WYNUA fhar ST IRaTfad & |

fdrgs © wWve 18 § T URT 390% Ud 390W @1 =AU fhar SIrHm
I ©

il @& @Wvs 19 # PR vd g o Sudy fHar S gwarfad € |

geh g Gl
HIHA]



Y 9g U

RGN B WA ST @ AR ST [Quad B SIdET
A ATIRe HiedT, SaNrdve (W) T AR HedT, SRS () e,
JRATT, 2025 2025
(SRTETS SEAISYl §¥&A © 03 94 2025) (Sorrave fagas | @ ay 2025)
TRT TR B ToUwRd a¥ ¥ reguTel | §RM ARG Hfed, SwRave, 2024 EICIEPE
g1 gt Geam—03 ¥, 2024) ¥ WRIEA PR B G,
wAFE AR Gfedl, SaRErs, 2024 ECRED
(iffram w03 ¥, 2024) # IR
deeE B & g, qRG TR @ Beawd 9§ H SwREvS
: gmﬂ—ﬁmmﬁmﬁfﬁﬁmﬁa%aﬁﬁ'ﬂﬁa
R 1. | (1) 39 ey &l Wi | wer || 1. (1) g9 Hiedr &1 |Ew A
TR™ SERIETE (i) (wiemer) wfRa, 2025 B |
TS, 2025 B | (2) @& ¥ W &1
(2) ¥® g Wg BN |
- 2. - dfedr @7 2. | @AM ATIRS  Afedl SwRIETS,
GiRICE 2024 (1 Tel oml Hel fedn
%8l g1 B) # Tue ufthar e
1973 (R am 6 ¥ 1973) ¥,
3, fore U9 @Iod & WM K,
Sel—el 98 A @ WRA™
aRe  geem  fedr, 2023
(@ffua & 46, @ 2023) ¥,
ap, forg w4 oo @ Ry
IR |
gy 7 s Tae  ARe | Oedn | 9WT 7 @1 3. | g0 §iedl @ "R 7 H SuR
@1 SEREve, 2024 (RO | WENEH (1) \?ﬂ‘f’rﬁﬁwﬁ. z;s'rrra*
e a8 e Ha e wE S e WY e S
T R) @ ™ 7§, v R s
st (1) @& fgdlE
qed H, BE AIE Ul
| & WF W) TH qY T
| wg fed SR |
gRT 10 | 4 | o dfedl W, BRI 10 H— | GRT 10 FT| 4. wel wfeal A, gR1 10 H—
@1 | (i) SwuR () ¥ oe | WEA - s e
e (I).GCI‘&IT?T()I# tr‘s'm%’ NEH]
v ot w= @ a%fem‘u? TH q§ TR Y
s ey Al ST,
| ‘(ii) SRl (3) H, 'B% (i) SweRT (3) #, ‘BT TE U |
' AE R @ ¥ W B WWE W TE aY TE 9 |
| B af g @ a3 | | 3 sman |
om0 g (e o __ |



| EIRT 11

T wfedl #, URI 11 H -
(i) S (3) ¥ 'BE
HE TSl @ WM W
wE a8 v <@ A
SIEE

(i) SwuwI (4) 4, ©E
e’ TRl B WTH W
TH ¥ v 39 o
SR |

gRT 11 @I

o1 WfRd |, URI 11 H— ¥
(i) ST (3) #, BE WE <l
& WH W TP a8 ¥ 9@ e |
ST

(i) SuumT (4) # B HIE
FWHEWR  TH AY LEe]
fer S |

gRT 12 6T

o |feal @ U™l 12 B ST
(1) # wfe = & WwHE W
TR WRE” g X9 A I |

gRT 17 DT

qel dfRdl B URT 17 & SWR
() #, "= wE T® B DBREAN
I Y BOR w9 O% Bl
mRd o1 TE B CUS B
AVHR B TR B WA W
YRAW  wrg dfedr, 2023
(ffwm w45, 99 2023) B
FTAR TS B ARMBRI B
v, G, g, ok dIed @
R ST |

gRT 19 @I

wel Wfedl @) URT 19 H, AN H
TUg e @ U R IRE’
vreg Y@ feur SRem |

J99 °RT
19% G
ST RRATYH

T Sfedl @ HRI 19 & gl
89 R 19%. d w9 H A
aferRenfie @R &) SR, et

"9, SU-fHeud UR wRd
R & e adia—
(1) W& gRT 19 @ oSfcd
Iu—dus w iRk sfeRifud
s |, 981 98 O fRag
& Wik U WeR N
Ted ardieiy uiider
& quer andel TR PR [ |

(2) SUERT (1) & 3fcld # g
aied, IRT 3M<w @ WA
ufa & e, fafga wu 4 ufba
¥ oyega @ ong, o &
Iy, R gR1 RaiRa faa
T 2| |
| @) adieliy wiferenTsy, |
| oagGANNR, N e¥ @B
| gfe, sumwRw @ fAREE R
| s

J




ORT 24 @1 10. | o1 Nfedl @) ORI 24 B TR
GRICE (1) #—

() wvs (@) ¥ “ forg @
Wﬁ‘mwﬁ?%ﬁ
g fed o,

(i) @ve (9) & U= Uh a1
wvs () freeq ofa=enfua
Fx e s, -

"(g) fo faae & w9y fAaE &
ol U UeTeR & HUH BT
& favg ¥ faean srqfieror faar

8"
aRT 25 @1 | 11.| I <fedl @) O 25 @ STR
e G @ wve () & e

yfereenfua ferar wirgn, serfa—

“i) Wy A fEE @
Hures / sigay b EESI|
TR,  goHYA,  grafddd
aferar ¥d AYA A fore €l U

Fea e 8l
ORT 26 @7 | 12. | % W(EQ1 DI URI 26 H SUERI
RiNICET () & we (i) 3R (i) ® w4

qen SWRT (3) @ @We () AR
(i) v, 3@, BoH iR e
@H:Wﬁﬁmﬁ'ﬁﬁrﬁﬁl

ORT 32 &1 | 13. | o1 |ieal @) °R] 32 Bl SN

ik () & e (i) B v @S
(iv), (v), (vi) ga (vii) f=7aq
S REOISE] w Ry wm,

arfarfe, 2006(3;@%%?1@6
a§ 2007) @ Sfctd qUEAIY B,

(v) Rraer ufer a1 ol Sfifad &,
IR B waod & gvEra U 4
® we () & Ieoad @ g
fpeY e @ foae wxan B, a
g8 RO Wiy Siedl, 2023
(aifafrm wear 45, @¥ 2023) &
siqefa gue &1 vl 8

(vi) 9o, <Em@ a1 RIS @ |

Az @ e oy A Rae @ |
| | for wenfa gma R 2, 9% W |




= = - m43ﬁ14.q§1ﬂ%maﬁwaﬁm

ST |
= = — oK1 384 BT | 15. | o Wied @1 o)1 384 H 3Hfan
e i G R e i1 M e s B | 22
ST SITe, i

2 1 < A I |
gl @, TS EWReR - gNT
fuiRa woz #§ He—d Hay
T M B FEU-UE SR
|

- — - ST 385 T | 16. | Fel TrecT @1 ORI 385 ¥

(i) SwaRr (1) # “TH wEAN
gl @ A IR 9F JEarar
W?@ﬁﬁm@;

(i) STuRI (2) F1 @AW &R
ST

(iii) ST (3) @'ﬂ‘a‘ﬂﬂﬁ
Tl @ WE WS
g <@ ol e |

- - - | a1 387 BT 17. Iol GiRal @) UKl 387 H, SWRI
RHICE (3) & gz SUURI (4), (5). (6).
W SR (7) e S &
ST, arefa—
| l"(4)uﬁaﬁ3‘mf%ﬁfﬁ,amam
| | e g R als @
3 g Ui @Y HE-arRl e
Wi @R 8, 1 98 HREN,
| e ol g @ d@ B
| Ted & <¥a frur s @R
| I@’Hﬁﬂv‘f‘ﬁm‘ﬁﬁ"ﬂl

‘\ = )_’”W‘ﬂﬁﬂ‘ﬂ 380(2) & |
] || SeeEd ¥ wE—gw # vEa@ # !

—




I Od 94 a6 P BREN |
Gfed fobar SR @on il @
A afy 8

g wlgE W
f=fl afs W o A8 B
R Fe—g g9y $1 |JHw
= oy 8 s Rrge aeh
& 9 9Y 7 oud e a7afd
J P war 7 |

fepar A
LRG| gfe gt

Te—arg Hay b1 gl 9rd 9y

(7) < @ «@fp R 380 @
IR (3) & Sooe H HE—a™
Hdy # Y818, 98 B AN T
3 WERV HRAE R gEd
EUR TP D1 A AR AT
2 R fReT HREN, W U@
79 qa fawaRa fear o g
2, gUS &1 9T BIT |

Ja9 °RT
3906 U4
3009 I
3T TUA

18.

Aol SfeaT DI G 390 D TR
72 URT 3908 Ud 3907 fAeTad
aawnflg @R ﬁ SR,
31erTe— |
300 USIH FIRET B DI
gifee—

e, doiep, We—drd  HUdl
SRR 9 gdftg  fasl
gofieeur & ARE a3 @ ufis

uRT 12 & fea Fga RRER
SN @l B

390 AR BT THRI—
gy dfgar @ SuEHl P st |

l___'?rrrrm T Pl W iR, |




Y XIoTRd B bl Bl AR A
o wfedr & i §AN Y
Prmt g fafafde ofbar &
SR gt fhar S [

frae 3R

19.

@) @A AmRe e
IERIETE (W) Aedne,
2025 (eORy  |AEOT-03 W,
2025) TageEw fARfa fawar S
&

) & fPr|T & 8 gy Wl
Jaa AT @ I @ TS
FI$ 917 T7 BRATS 9 Giedl @
g Suedt @ | @ T
FAET Sl |

g=hR RiE el
HI0 RHHA




The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Bill, 2025
(Uttarakhand Bill No. Year 2025)

A
Bill

to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of 2024),

Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Uttarakhand in the Seventy-
sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows:

Short title and i
commencement
Amendment in s B
Code

Amendment of 3.
section 7

Amendment of 4.
section 10

Amendment of 5.
section 11

Amendment of 6.
section 12

(1) This Act may be called the Uniform Civil Code,
Uttarakhand (Amendment) Act, 2025.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

In the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Code) for the
words, figures, signs and brackets “Criminal
Procedure Code , 1973 (Act No 2. year 1974)”,
wherever they occurs, the words, figures, signs and
brackets “Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023
(Act No. 46 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

In section 7 of the principal Code, in the second
proviso to the sub-section (1), for the words 'six
months', the words 'one year' shall be substituted.

In the principal Code, in section 10,-

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words ‘six months’, the
words 'one year' shall be substituted;

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words ‘six months’, the
words 'one year' shall be substituted.

In the principal Code, in section 11,-

(i) in sub-section (3), for the words ‘six months’, the
words 'one year' shall be substituted:

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words ‘six months’, the
words 'one year' shall be substituted.

In sub-section (1) of section 12 of the principal Code,
for the word “Secretary”, the words “Additional
Secretary” shall be substituted.



Amendment of
section 17

Amendment of
section 19

Insertion of new
section 19 A

Amendment of
section 24

: Amendment of
section 25

< 2

10.

11,

In sub-section (2) of section 17 of the principal Code,
for the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to three months, or with
fine not exceeding twenty-five thousand rupees, or
with both”, the words, figures, signs and brackets
“shall be punishable according to the provisions
contained in the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act
No. 45 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

In section 19 of the principal Code, in the heading,
for the word “fine”, the word “penalty” shall be
substituted.

After Section 19 of the principal Code, a new section
19A shall be inserted as follows, namely—

“19A. Appeal against penalty imposed on Sub-
Registrar-

(1) Where a penalty has been imposed on a Sub-
Registrar under Section 19, he may prefer an appeal
within thirty days before the competent appellate
authority as notified by the State Government.

(2) An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be
presented in the prescribed form and manner
along with a certified copy of the order of penalty, as
determined by the State Government.

(3) The appellate authority may, as it deems
necessary, confirm, modify, or annul such order.”.

In sub-section (1) of section 24 of the principal
Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the sign “.” , the *; or” sign and
word shall be substituted,;

(ii) after clause (d), a new clause (e) shall be inserted
as follows, namely:-

“(e) that at the time of the marriage one of the
parties to the marriage had misrepresented her/his
identity.”.

In section 25 of principal Code, clause (i) of sub-
section (3) shall be substituted as follows, namely-

“(i) the husband has, since the solemnization/



Amendment of
section 26

Amendment of
section 32

Amendment of
section 43

Amendment of
section 384

Amendment of
section 385

12,

13.

14,

15.

16.

contracting of the marriage, indulged in rape, anal
sex, bestiality or necrophiliac sexual intercourse.”.

In section 26 of the principal Code
after “clauses (i) and (ii) of sub-section (2),
the words figures, signs and brackets “and clauses (i)
and (ii) of sub-section (3)” shall be inserted.

In section 32 of the principal code after clause (iii)
new clauses (iv), (v), (vi) and (vii) shall be inserted as
follows, namely-

“(iv) contracts a marriage in violation of clause (iii)
of section 4, such act shall be punishable under the
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No. 6
of 2007);

(v) having a husband or wife living, marries
another person after the commencement of the
Code and in contravention of clause (i) of section
4, shall be punishable under the The Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023);

(vi) obtains the consent of a person for Marriage by
force, coercion or fraud shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to
seven years and shall also be liable to fine;

(vii) procured the consent for marriage through
misrepresentation or concealment of facts then
such act shall be punishable under the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023).”.

In section 43 of the principal code in sub-section (1) ,
in clause (c), for the words “the court shall decree
such relief accordingly”, the words and brackets “the
court shall grant such relief in accordance with
clauses (a), (b) and (c)” shall be substituted.

In principal code after last sentence of section 384,
the following sentence shall be added, namely-

“In such a cases, the registrar shall issue a certificate
regarding termination of the live-in relationship, in a
prescribed format to both the partners.”.

In section 385 of the principal code.-
(i) in sub-section (1), for the words "such partner(s)",



Amendment of
section 387

17.

the words "those partner(s)" shall be substituted;
(ii) sub-section (2) has been omitted;

(iii) in sub-section (3), for the words "such
partner(s)", the words "those partner(s)" shall be
substituted.

In section 387 of the principal Code, after sub-section
(3), sub-sections (4), (5), (6) and sub-section (7) shall
be added, namely-

«“(4) Whoever obtains the consent of any person by
force, coercion or fraud to establish a live-in
relationship shall be punishable with imprisonment
for a term which may extend to seven years and shall
also be liable to fine.

(5) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship
in persistent contravention of sub-section (2)
of section 380 shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to
seven years and shall also be liable for fine:

Provided that, nothing in this sub-section shall
apply to a person who has terminated the live-in
relationship or whose partner has not been heard of
for a period of seven years or more.

(6) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship without
duly terminating the previous marriage and
concluding all legal proceedings, if any, arising
therefrom, shall be punishable as per section 82 of the
Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita:

Provided that, where the partner of the
previous live-in relationship has been absent or
missing for a period of seven years or more, such
person shall be permitted to register a new live-in
relationship.

(7) Whoever lives in a live-in relationship in
contravention of sub-section (3) of Section 380 shall
be punishable with simple imprisonment for a term
which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to fifty thousand rupees; and in default of



Insertion of new
sections 390A
and 390B

Repeal and
savings

18.

g o

payment of such fine, with further imprisonment
which may extend.”.

In principal code after section 390 new sections 390A
and 390B shall be inserted as follows, namely:—

“390A. Power to cancel registration-

The power to cancel any registration relating to
marriage, divorce, live-in relationship or succession
shall lie with the Registrar General appointec under
Section 12.”

“390B. Recovery of penalty-
Any penalty imposed under the provisions of
this Code shall be recovered like arrears of land

revenue or in such manner as may be specified by
rules made under this Code.”.”

(1) The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or
any action taken under the said Ordinance shall
be deemed to have been done or taken under
the corresponding provisions of this Code.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

After the enforcement of the Uttarakhand Uniform Civil Code, 2024 (Act No. 03 of
2024), it was found necessary to amend certain provisions of the Code in light of the
experience gained during its implementation, suggestions received from various
stakeholders, and emerging legal requirements. -

The present Amendment Bill primarily seeks to-

Extend certain procedural timelines from six months to one year.

Make provisions relating to marriage registration, divorce, live-in relationships,
and succession more clear and effective, and to specifically include acts such as
misrepresentation, concealment of serious criminal convictions, and obtaining
consent for marriage through force, coercion or fraud, as punishable offences.
Align the existing penal provisions with the "Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita, 2023"
and the "Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023".

Provide a procedure for appeal against penalty orders imposed on Sub-
Registrars.

Provide for issuance of a certificate upon termination of a live-in relationship
and to prescribe stricter penalties in cases of continuous violation.

Clearly lay down the method of recovery of penalties.

Repeal the Uttarakhand Uniform Civil Code (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025.
The objective of these amendments is to make the Code more practical,
equitable, and effective, thereby ensuring the protection of the interests of all
sections of society while facilitating the smooth functioning of legal processes.

2-  The proposed Bill is the replacing Bill of said ordinance and fulfills the aforesaid
objectives.

Pushkar Singh Dhami
Chief Minister



LEGISLATIVE MEMORANDUM

1. The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Bill, 2025 is to be enacted by
the proposed Bill.

2. The proposed Bill only involves the general delegation of legislative powers.

Pushkar Singh Dhami
Chief Minister



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

. The proposed Bill seeks to enact the Uniform Civil Code. Uttarakhand (Amendment)
Bill 2025.

. The proposed Bill does not contain the recurring or non-recurring expenditure from
consolidated fund of State.

Pushkar Singh Dhami
Chief Minister



CLAUSE-WISE MEMORANDUM

The proposed Bill seeks to enact the Uttarakhand Uniform Civil Code (Amendment)
Bill, 2025.

i

ol g

OO*-.JCJ\UI

10.
11,
12.
13.
14.
15
16.
17.
18.

19.

It is proposed to provide for the short title and commencement of the in Clause 1
of the Bill.

In Clause 2 of the Bill proposed to amend the Code.

In Clause 3 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 7 of the Code.

In Clause 4 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 10 of the Code.

In Clause S of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 11 of the Code.

In Clause 6 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 12 of the Code.

In Clause 7 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 17 of the Code.

In Clause & of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 19 of the Code.

In Clause 9 of the Bill proposed to insert the new Section 19A in the Code.
In Clause 10 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 24 of the Code.

In Clause 11 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 25 of the Code.

In Clause 12 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 26 of the Code.

In Clause 13 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 32 of the Code.

In Clause 14 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 43 of the Code.

In Clause 15 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 384 of the Code.

In Clause 16 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 385 of the Code.

In Clause 17 of the Bill proposed to amend the Section 387 of the Code.

In Clause 18 of the Bill proposed to insert the new Section 390A and 390B in the
Code.

In Clause 19 of the Bill provisions of repeal and savings are proposed.

Pushkar Singh Dhami
Chief Minister



Memorandum of Difference

section 10

in section 10,-

[ (1) in sub-section (2),

! section 10

| words

[ Provisions of the Ordinance Provisions of the proposed bill in addition to the
ordinance
The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand
(Amendment) Ordinance, 2025 (Amendment) Bill, 2025
(Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 03 Year 2025) (Uttarakhand Bill No.____ Year 2025)
| Promulgated by the Govenor in the Seventy- | to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024
Sixth Year of the Republic of India (Act No. 03 of 2024).
. A
Further to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Bill
Uttarakhand, 2024 (Act No. 03 of 2024), .
Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of
Ordinance Uttarakhand in the Seventy-sixth Year of the Republic
ke of India as follows:
Short title and 1 | (1) This Ordinance | Short title and | - (1), This code may be called
commencement may be called the | commencement the Uniform Civil Code,
Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment)
code, 2025.
:'Kt;l;a:;;{;it) (2) It shall come into force
at once.
Ordinance, 2025,
(2) It shall come into
force at once. i
o s = Amendment in | 2. In the Uniform Civil
Code Code, Uttarakhand, 2024
(hereinafter referred to as
the principal Code) for the
words, figures, signs and
brackets “Criminal
Procedure Code , 1973 (Act
No 2. year 1973)”, wherever
they occurs, the words,
figures, signs and brackets
“Bharatiya Nagarik
Suraksha Sanhita. 2023 (Act
No. 46 of 2023)” shall be
substituted.
Amendmentof | 3. |In section 7 of the | Amendment of | 3. In section 7 of the principal
section 7 Uniform Civil Code. | section 7 Code, in the second proviso
Uttarakhand. 2024 to the sub-section (1), for the
(hereinafter referred to words 'six months'. the
as the principal Code), words 'one year' shall be
| in the second proviso substituted.
‘ to the sub-section (1),
. for the words 'six
months', the words 'one
vear' shall be
R - | substituted : —
Amendment of | 4- | In the principal Code, = Amendment of | 4. | 1In the principal Code. in

section 10,-
(i) in sub-section (2). for the
‘six months’,

the



for the words ‘six words 'one year' shall be
months’, the words substituted:
'one  year' shall be (ii) in sub-section (3), for the
; words ‘six months’, the
substituted; : :
ButF) : i words 'one vyear' shall be
(ii) in sub-section (3.), | substituted.
for the words ‘six
= months’, the words
'one year' shall be
substituted. 45
Amendment of | 5- | In the principal Code, | Amendment of | 5. | In the principal Code, in
section 11 in section 11,- section 11 section 11,-
(i) in sub-section (3), (1) in sub-slection (3), for the
for' ilie. wolds ‘eix words ‘six months’, the
: words 'one year' shall be
months’, the words sibstituted:
'one year' shall be (ii) in sub-section (4), for the
substituted; words ‘six months’, the
(i1) in sub-section (4). words 'one year' shall be
for the words ‘six substituted.
months’, the words
'one year' shall be
substituted. '
— — - Amendment of | §- | In sub-section (1) of section
section 12 12 of the principal Code, for
the word “Secretary”, the
words “Additional
Secretary” shall be
substituted.
- — — Amendment of | 7. | In sub-section (2) of section
section 17 17 of the principal Code, for
the words  “shall be
punishable with |
imprisonment for a term
which may extend to three
months, or with fine not
exceeding twenty-five
thousand rupees. or with
both”, the words. figures,
signs and brackets “shall be
punishable according to the
provisions contained in the
Bharativa Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023)”
shall be substituted.
L ] L2, Amendment of | 8- |In section 19 of the
section 19

principal Code, in the

heading,  for the word
“fine”, the word
“penalty” shall be
substituted.
— - o= Insertion of new | Q. After Section 19 of the |
section 19 A principal Code, a new |

section 19A shall be inserted
| as follows, namely—
| “19A.  Appeal

against |




penalty imposed on Sub-
Registrar-

(1) Where a penalty has
been imposed on a Sub-
Registrar under Section 19,
he may prefer an appeal
within thirty days before the
competent appellate
authority as notified by the
State Government.

(2) An appeal under sub-
section (1) shall be
presented in the prescribed
form and manner along
with a certified copy of the
order of punishment, as
determined by the State
Government.

(3) The appellate authority
may, as it deems necessary,
confirm, modify, or annul
such order.

Amendment
section 24

of

In sub-section (1) of
section 24 of the
principal Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the
sign “.” , the “; or” sign
and word shall be
substituted;

(ii) after clause (d), a new
clause (e) shall be
inserted as  follows,
namely:-

“(e) that at the time of the
marriage one of the parties
to the marriage had

misrepresented her/his
identity.”.

Amendment
section 25

of

11-

In section 25 of principal
Code, clause (i) of sub-
section (3) shall be
substituted as follows,
namely-

“(1) the husband has,
since the solemnization/
contracting of the |
marriage, indulged in
rape or bestiality or
necrophiliac sexual
intercourse.”.

Amendment
section 26

of

In section 26 of the |

| principal Code
| after “clauses (i) and (i)
| of sub-section  (2)",




the words figures, signs
and brackets “and clauses
(i) and (ii) of sub-section
(3)” shall be inserted.

Amendment
section 32

of

13-

In section 32 of the
principal code after clause
(iii) new clauses (iv), (v),
(vi) and (vii) shall be
inserted as follows,
namely-

“(iv) contracts a marriage
in violation of clause (iii)
of section 4, such act
shall be punishable under
the Prohibition of Child
Marriage Act, 2006 (Act
No. 6 of 2007),

(v) having a husband or
wife living.  marries
another person after the
commencement of the
Code and in
contravention of clause
(i) of section 4. shall be
punishable under the The
Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of
2023);

(vi) obtains the consent
of a person for Marriage
by force, coercion or
fraud shall be punishable
with imprisonment for a
term which may extend
to seven years and shall
also be liable to fine;

(vii) procured the consent
for  marriage  through
misrepresentation or
concealment of facts then
such act shall be punishable
under the Bharativa Nyaya
Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45
of 2023).”.

Amendment
section 43

of

In section 43 of the
principal code in sub-

| section (1) . in clause (c).

for the words “the court
shall decree such relief
accordingly”, the words

ety




L

and brackets “the court |

shall grant such relief in
accordance with clauses
(a), (b) and (c)” shall be
substituted.

Amendment
section 384

of | 15-

In principal code after last
sentence of section 384,
the following sentence
shall be added, namely-
“In such a cases, the
registrar shall issue a
certificate regarding
termination of the live-in
relationship. n a
prescribed format to both
the partners.”.

Amendment
section 385

of | 16-

In section 385 of the
principal code.-

(i) in sub-section (1), for
the words "such
partner(s)", the words
"those partner(s)" shall be
substituted;

(ii) sub-section (2) has
been omitted:

(iii) in sub-section (3), for
the words "such partner(s)",

the words "those partner(s)"
shail be substituted.

Amendment
section 387

of | 17-

In section 387 of the
principal Code, after sub-
section (3), sub-sections
@), (5). (6) and sub-
section (7) shall be added,
namely-

“(4) Whoever obtains the
consent of any person by
force, coercion or fraud to

establish a live-in
relationship ~ shall  be
punishable with

imprisonment for a term
which may extend to
seven years and shall also
be liable to fine.

(5) Whoever stays in a
live-in relationship
in persistent
contravention of  sub-

section (2) of section 380 |

| shall be punishable with




»

imprisonment for a term
which may extend to
seven years and shall also
be liable for fine:

Provided that, nothing

in this sub-section shall
apply to a person who has
terminated the live-in
relationship or whose
partner has not been
heard of for a period of
seven years Or more. -
(6) Whoever stays in a
live-in relationship
without duly terminating
the previous marriage and
concluding all legal
proceedings, if any,
arising therefrom, shall be
punishable as per section
82 of the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanbhita:

Provided that. where the
partner of the previous
live-in relationship has
been absent or missing
for a period of seven
years or more, such
person shall be permitted
to register a new live-in
relationship.

(7) Whoever lives in a live-
in relationship in
contravention of sub-section
(3) of Section 380 shall be
punishable ~ with  simple
imprisonment for a term
which may extend to six
months and with fine which
may extend to fifty
thousand rupees: and in
default of payment of such
fine. with further
imprisonment which may
extend.”.

Insertion of new

sections
and 390B

390A

In principal code after
section 390 new sections
390A and 390B shall be
inserted as  follows.
namely:—

“390A. Power to cancel
registration-




| 1

The power to cancel
any registration relating
to marriage, divorce, live-
in relationship or
succession shall lie with
the Registrar General

appointed - under
Section 12.

390B. Recovery of
penalty-

Any penalty imposed
under the provisions of this
Code shall be recovered
like arrears of land revenue
or in such manner as may
be specified by rules made
under this Code.”.”

Repeal
savings

(1) The Uniform Civil Code,
Uttarakhand (Amendment)
Ordinance, 2025 is hereby
repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such
repeal, anything done or
any action taken under the
said Ordinance shall be
deemed to have been done
or taken under the
corresponding provisions of
this Code.

Pushkar Singh Dhami

Chief Minister




	UK_UCC_Bill_2025.pdf
	UK_UCC_1(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_2(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_3(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_4(1).pdf

	UK_UCC_Bill_2025a.pdf
	UK_UCC_5(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_6(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_7(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_8(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_9(1).pdf
	UK_UCC_10(1).pdf

	UK_UCC_Bill_2025b.pdf
	UK_UCC_11.pdf
	UK_UCC_12.pdf
	UK_UCC_13.pdf
	UK_UCC_14.pdf

	UK_UCC_Bill_2025c.pdf
	UK_UCC_15.pdf
	UK_UCC_16.pdf
	UK_UCC_17.pdf
	UK_UCC_18.pdf
	UK_UCC_19.pdf

	UK_UCC_Bill_2025d.pdf
	UK_UCC_20.pdf
	UK_UCC_21.pdf
	UK_UCC_22.pdf
	UK_UCC_23.pdf
	UK_UCC_24.pdf
	UK_UCC_25.pdf

	UK_UCC_Bill_2025e.pdf
	UK_UCC_26.pdf
	UK_UCC_27.pdf
	UK_UCC_28.pdf
	UK_UCC_29.pdf
	UK_UCC_30.pdf
	UK_UCC_31.pdf


