A G107 gofteor §E—UA/DO/DDN/30/2024-2026

THIY) T F7vleTos

STRIEUS UNHIR g1 U1

STHTEINT

faamrll aRf¥rse
12, ©vS (b)
(SavrEvs e )

QENIGH, AIAdR, 27 SIHa), 2026 30
ATE 07, 1947 W HHd

SEKECESRIIEE]
feurft ved wudlm & fawmr
e 25 / XXXVI (3) /2026 / 05(1) / 2026
QENIG, 27 OFa¥), 2026

srferg ==
fafaer

Y BT AR B SEE 213 ® @S (1) @ AL Wo SITIe q WA
AR wfear, SoREve (FeeE) swAaey, 20260 TEAfug fdur € SR U8
IRRUS A BT AT G 02 T§—2026 B HY F FI—AEIRYT & G

g SMEgEET gRT WeTRIe [dRuT ST 2



2 SIRTETS TR TWE, 27 WIaY, 2026 30 (AT9 07, 1947 OF A=)

A ANIRSG Higdl, STREvS (GeNU) SEaay, 2026
TavrETe JoTeY e - 02, 99 2026
GIRT TRy % foaaRd af # st R g

A AR iR, SRIRIEUS, 2024 (SRRITS AR F@ar—03 a9, 2024)

¥ sraR W By B faI,

YT 9T

by

qfds, Iog @ Qe @ w7 FE § SR ISue BT A8 AERIA &) T 8
fé o= aRRerfoar femm 8, R SRor 978 TR=T BRaTg BYT Saws &8 T 8

3FIYY, 376, VYU R Bl WEAYM ® STeT 213 @ WUS (1) gN Wewl
oIl @1 YA wRa gV ol sy wenfiy e 8-

e A L (1) 50 oEASY B GRIT AT HE ARG wed,
3R wewT TRINEUS (HEF) gy, 2026 ¢ |
(2) WE o= U B0
wfear & 2. G TR IR, SeRRAvS, 2024 (S F8T o
SNISES ol Wiedr wsl war 8) " gve ufsur wfgar to73
(tferfram |war oz, 9 1974) wE, S G faw B
WM W, SRR 98 AN § CWRG ARG R
e, 2023 (rafaw wRer 46, a¥ 2023) e, s
Td e v R o |
ORT 7 B 3, e iR @ uRT 7 A, SN (1) @ A URegs ¥,
GHICET "OE HET YRl @ W W TH q9 e 3@
STRIT |
BIRT 10 7 4, | vel R % owmr 10 K- B
L (1) SUURT (2) ¥, "898 9" IRk @ WH W® U 9"
veg R (&8 S
(il) STV (3) H BE R GR D WM R T
oy g w9 A SIRE




SURTETS MR Tole, 27 WAd<), 2026 30 (ATH 07, 1947 ¥E W)

&7 11 T 5. | He wfgen 4, 11 H-
LUy (i) ST (3) ¥, B HIE Wl @ Wi ® T
HESRSCIREE T /e
(ii) SUIRT (4) ¥, "By #E" A= © W W T
i e @ Ry Wi |
MRT 12 BT | 6. | o1 QRdT @I G’ 12 @) SuHRT (1) § vk AR B
e WM W ¥ "R afag’ W &y S|
T 13 @B | 7. | el dfear B GRT 13 @ QUERT (3) Bl freag] Hresentid
GHIEET DY fear SR, - :
afe Su-freye wuaer (2) § iRy awarta
FRAE] @ 4 A% w8, dl S9  [UE,
fare—foess ar fQae @1 erpdar orar ff 99al &), &
wEiferd w9 W FEue @ wHer orifya w1 Sme wur
afe frdue fuiRa aaarria SRR o@ 3 e
TEET § O AETNENE & qHeT S & 9 |
URTA7 BT | 8 | o1 WA O GRT A7 B OSUEART (2) ¥,
e AN AIE T S BRART AN TE R B T bl
o Ut 2 B qUS BT HESNT B Y] @ UM W
R4 =g wfRan 2023 @RraE w45, g 2023) ¥
AfgT grErEl @ SR GvsHIg BRI 9|, 3@ SR
s v ol WRf | |
arRT 19 BT 9. e weem @ a1 19 H, NiH § GO IF B WIH R
LI oA v @ fen S |
A 10, | 991 w@fRem @1 ONT 19 & UvEw [reelEd  ERT
195 BT sferenfie @ § W, Jerfa-
SRR “19%. SU—-FrEuE W A SRR & fawe andier-
(1) IET &Ry 19 @ efaela SU--fee U Re SRR
@1 AT g1, g 98 O R & WIR TS WRBR GR
SRRgRE Wer sriiely wIieRprd & el el SR
B D] |




IIRTETS IR TolC, 27 W9, 2026 S0 (ATE 07, 1947 ¥H 6HQ)

(2) QUMY (1) & ST @ Mg i, WRT T B
yaior wfer @ W, fofta wwo vd A # wwga @
ol S T oy IR g RuiRa fear g |

(3) erdiel uifdrprdy, U 3Ry &l Y&, SuWdaRd o
YR BN W], Ol a8 Siod FEHA ||

[

ERT 24 BT o ARar & G9RT 24 B FULURT (1) §—

i (i) @ve (@) % “|” forg & M | ;AT TR 3R
(i) wos (9) & e Frfiea wue sawmiia &
ferar SrnT, srrfa—

“(g) 5 faae & wg fdaw @ & b ugeR A
ot veE & fawa # fear gy e 8y

SIRT 25 B 12, | wa e d axr 25 @ swERr (6) @ wve (i) @

GHICER fererac] nftrerfter & fear s, sreifda—

() oy farE @ SIS /ST EaT B U IelleoN,
[ETHYE, URETHA 3ferar wg A H for & ur

gRT 26 BT 13. | wer Wi @ G726 F weq, o iR Rrg IwEm (2)

HER & we (i) AR (i) & W W) s, 3w i =g qon
SULNT (2) T4 SueRy (3) wfoeenta w5 f§4 S |

oRT 32 &7 14, | He wiear § o 32 @ SubRT (1) e gRwenfid |

Heled IR Q1 AR, -

“(1) org W =fdd -

(i) forerer ofy o1 U oifag B, wfgen & yReT 8F @
LA IR 4 B ES (i) B Seaud dra gV B Iy
W fEE oxa 5 @ 98 YRAY S GiRdn 2023
(rfrfers v 45, 9 2023) & S qUE @1 WY
ET'T[; ;
(ii) OTRT 4 B TS (iii) BT IecraT PR fadTE wRav B, @




SIRTEUS IHTERYT ToE, 27 WH4a3, 2026 30 (419 07, 1947 UF )

SEHT JE G ol faaE wieyy sifEfE, 2008
(@i w6, @ 2007) & sfefa quedT B

(iii) &)1 4 & @S (iv) & Seouw § fagre o guw
FRAl 8, 98 U S O P ARRY HRE R TH
EOIR ST TEH BT FAT R AT T 37 W AR
PRERT, G (P 7€ ad [AO&IRA fhar &1 9édr &, &
TUS BT 9F AT,

(iv) 9T 29 & Soerg H foae Rufe @=ar 8, 98 44
9§ TF @ BRE @ QUS BT AT SHIAT DT HIT BT,
(v) foer safe @f qafdare 9 ugl oNT 30 &1 IUERT
() ¥ Piffe el ff a1 & SgwY SR B B R
foqe, gURT a1 AMURT @xem . 98 O 9¥ @@ @l
3E® & BRE T U e mﬁ qF W AT AR
Ufﬁ_fﬁ T3 R B AR a9 & -ofRed sRE @ 308
T HAT BT,

(vi) @er, gura o7 ORIl & wegd o fee wfd| @
faare @ fav <Eafa i< oxar 8, 98 9@ Y q% P
FREE 9 gfved fFar ST ofe S @1 ot A
BT

(vii) foare @ forg s ygwr, daige Refd o foumm
B U e WHEGN <l §, 1 SUP U By RN
g wfedn, 2023 @Sy wweEm 45, 99 2023) @

. 4 [ N re
AT <usHE 8NN

ERT 43 PT 15. ol Wfedr & &R 43 § IUERT (1) B ofd H, “yre

e TEIIR U a1 enefa uiiRa Gorg) | e
WM W TG @vs (@), (@) 9UT (1) F TR
A R X wes 3R forg < e Wi |

gRT 384 BT | 16 o Gfedr ¥ grT 384 @ o9 ¥ FEfiied wew wd R

BRILE] e fad IR, erifa—

O HTEEl ?ﬁemﬁm&lﬁﬁmw




TORTETS SNTERYT e, 27 SFa¥), 2026 30 (W€ 07, 1947 & GHd)

exr PR oo A dear Wey wwrE BN @r
T SR BT | |

ST 385 @T| 7, | el Giecl Bl G e85 A—
e () ST (1) H U wEal” Wl d WM W9
wearal” g ¥ ey o,
(i) SUYRT (2) BT AT P (AT SIRATT;
(i) Suen=T (3) ® U WEArE weal & I W ¥
FeaRel” e W 3y S|
gRT 387 @1 18. | Hol Wieal @ ORI 387 W, ST (3) @ U9
I - FEfoRaT SUeRIG fa-nfue oY <7 S, arRifq—

“(a) afe @Iy o g, a9 YT GG GRT A
afts @ el O dR WAl ey U Rar b,
a1 g e o, et sEafy Wi 9y 9@ 8 wedl g,
fea fosar SR ok A @t off =l gy

(5) &1 @I M 9T 380 W JULRT (2) P JeoEd Hd
wEardl wry ¥ wear 8, @ 9 9§ 9% & HREN ¥
<& far SR I 9% A T A S @

U] 3 SUYRT B BRI A fE aRe w
S T8 BRTT R wgardl Wy el wH @) fear gl
ey Rrres Wl @ vy # @ q¥ a7 9w sifee |-
oEf ¥ FE B 7 8 N

(6) W B TIP WRH ORI 380 B SWRT (3) &
TooraT ¥ fordl orayres & Wiy WAl Wey ¥ e g,

T 98 T A T @ R BRER SR A W Sl

TER AR GUY P BT A WD 3R AT GAAT 7 a9
v FfRed PREa™, S Th 7 d% [GERa fear o
qedT B, ¥ gfvea fhar S "Ha




STRTETS JETEROT oe, 27 Was, 2026 S0 (ATE 07, 1947 S WHA) 7

S R 19 | o WfRa ¥ uxrose0 & wyEng frefafed eR
390% Tq araxenfae we < oA, arerld—
390 .

“390%. YOI FREd B DI wiaw—

RRATT
) Rare, Rras—fese, Teard ey aud STURER 9
e fordt qofleor ) I B3 @) afth uRT 12 @
gifa fged . Aetfewrs @ Rl 09 gelewe @l
e 58 @ A qd Feiasass gy sndes ] Jearg
T YUl SawR o SR |

390w, WIRT & Tl

s diker @ sudyl & siada @l T B8 0 i,
Y-IGRG B qHR @ AIRT ar g9 dlkar & i
Tore e et gy RS ufbe & sar aqa @1

STeft |
SEE2 @T| 20. | A Wledl ¥ SFRE—2 @ SUN—1 @ BH awd-3 A
geneE _ g CAawer @ wR gfy /el v v QY
STRAT |
R 21. I ATRE GiET, SERMGTS (W) JSTay, 2025

o

(erereer w03 a4, 2025) @ IR H TS FIF AW
AT HRAE $F JEARY B Ao SUSEl & 3R ol
TE GHEl S | ‘

dosoHIa RiE,
fiodloTHoTHD, FOITE0THOTHO,
godovgowdo, flogwogdo (Harf-igs)
AT, ITATETS |

e
g Aqad),
nqE Wfuq |



8 FAMETE IR oI, 27 T8, 2026 30 (ATH 07, 1947 IS )

No. 25/XXXVI(3)/2026/05(1)/2026
Dated Dehradun, January 27, 2026

NOTIFICATION

Miscellaneous
In pursuance of the provisions of Clause (3} of Article 348 of the

Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the

following English translation of ‘The Uniform Civil Code, Uitarakhand

{Amendment) Ordinance, 2026’ (Uttarakhand Ordinance No, 02 of 2026).

As promulgated by the Governor on 26 January, 2026.

The Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand {(Amendment) Ordinance, 2026

[Uttarakhand Ordinance No. 02 Year 2026]

Promuigated by the Governor in the Sevently-sixth Year of the Republic of India
& = v .

AN
ORDINANCE

turther to amend the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (Uttarakhand Act
No. 03 of the year, 2024), '

“Whereas, the Legislative Assembly of the State is not in session and the
Governor is satisfied that circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take
immediate action;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:-

(1) :_F'his Ordinance may be Lf-éflec{ the Uniform C_m[ Code,

ba

Short title and | 1. ‘

SIILE AR R { L] iy
tommencement | Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2026.

(21 Tt shall come into force at once.
| ;

ik D la | v Sk hE ey ) R i
Aamendment in | 2. | [ the Uniform Civil Code, Uttarakhand, 2024 (hercinafter
L referred to as the principal Code) for the words, figures

and signs “Criminal Procedure Code, 1973 (Act No 2 year

‘ 1974y, wherever they occur, the words, [lgures and SIgns

- “Bharatiya Nagarik Suraksha Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 46
0f2023)” shall be substituted.




ITRIEYE MR Iole, 27 Wad, 2026 30 (AT9 07, 1947 ¥ WHQ) 9

Amendment of
section 7

3.

[n section 7 of the principal Code, in the second proviso of
the sub-section (1), for the words “six months”, the words
“one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 10

In the principal Code, in section 10,-
(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 11

In the principal Code, in section [ 1,-

(i).in sub-section (3), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted,

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the words “six months”, the
words “one year” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 12

In sub-section (1) of section 12 of the principal Code, for
the word “Secretary”, -the words “Additional Secretary”

shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 13

In the principal Code, sub-section (3) of Section 13 shall
be substituted as follows, namely:—

“If the Sub-Registrar fails to take action within the time
period prescribed under sub-section (2), the marriage,
divorce or declaration of nullity of marriage, as the case
may be, shall automatically get forwarded to the Registrar,
and if the Registrar fails to take action within the
prescribed time period, it shall get forwarded to the

i C— . 11]
Registrar general.”.

Amendment of
section 17

In sub-section (2) of section 17 of the principal Code, for
the words “shall be punishable with imprisonment for a
term which may extend to three months, or with fine not
exceeding twenty-five thousand rupees, or with both”, the
words, figures and signs “shall be punishable according to
the provisions contained in the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023)” shall be substituted.

Amendmcnt of
section 19

In section 19 of the principal Code, in the heading, for the

word word “penalty” shall be

substituted.

“punishment”, the

Insertion of new
section 19 A

10,

shall be inserted, namely—

“J19A. Appeal against penalty imposed on Sub-

Registrar-




10 VUGS TR NlE, 27 S4¥), 2026 30 (ATH 07, 1947 €& UHq)

1 (1) Where a penalty has been ilﬁ}ibsed on a Sub-Registrar

under section 19, he may prefer an appeal within
thirty days before the competent appellate authority
as notified by the State Government.

(2) An appeal under sub-section (1) shall be presented
along with certified copy of the order of penalty in
the prescribed form and manner, as determined by the
State Government.

(3) The appellate authority may, confirm, modify or annul
such order as it deems necessary.”.

Amendment of
section 24

1.

In sub-section (1) of section 24 of the principal Code,-

(i) in clause (d) for the sign “.” , the *; or” sign and word’
shall be substituted;

(ii) after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted
as follows, namely:-

“(e) that at the time of the marriage one of the parties to

the marriage had misrepresented his/her identity.”.

Amendment of
section 25

B

In the principal Code, clause (i) of sub-section (3) of
section 25 shall be substituted as follows, namely-

“(i) the husband has, since the solemnization/
conftracting of the marriage, indulged in rape, anal sex,
bestiality or necrophiliac sexual intercourse; or.”.

Amendment of
section 26

In section 26 of the principal Code after words, figures
and signs “clauses (i) and (i) of sub-section (2)”, the
words, figures and signs “sub-section (2) and sub-section
(3)” shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 32

14.

In the principal Code, sub-section (1) of section 32 shall
be substituted as follows, namely—
“(1) Any person who-

(i) having a husband or wife is living, marriage another
person after the commencement of the Code in
contravention of clause (i) of section 4, shall be
punishable under the Bharatiya Nyaya Sanhita,
2023 (Act No. 45 of 2023); _

('i%') contracts a marriage in contravention of clause (iif)
of section 4, such act shall be punishable under the
Prohibition of Child Marriage Act, 2006 (Act No.
6 of 2007);

(iii) procures a marriage in contravention of clause (iv)
of section 4 shall be punishable with simple
imprisonment for a term which may extend (o six |




STRREUS TR THe, 27 W-a¥l, 2026 30 (AT 07, 1947 UH W)

11

months and with fine not exceeding rupees fifty
thousand, and in default of fine, to undergo further
imprisonment for a term which may extend to one
month; '

(iv) dissolves a marriage in contravention of section 29
shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to three years and shall also be
liable to fine;

(v) compels, abets or induces a person to obst.rve any
condition as is referred to in sub-section (2) of
section 30 before remarriage shall be publishable
with imprisonment for a term which may extend to
three vears and shall also be liable to fine of rupees
one lakh, and in default of fine, to undergo further
imprisonment for a term which may extend to six
months;

(vi) obtains the consent of a person for marriage by
force, coercion or fraud shall be punishable with
imprisonment for a term which may extend to
seven years and shall also be liable to [ine;

(vil) procured the consent for marriage through
misrepresentation or concealment of facts then
such act shall be punmhable under ‘the Bharatiya
Nyaya Sanhita, 2023 (Act No. 45 0£2023).”.

Amendr_nent of
sectiom 43

15.

In section 43 of the principal Code, at the end of in sub-
section (1), for the words “the Court shall decree such
relief accordingly.”, the words and sign “the Court shall
grant relief in accordance with clauses (a), (b) and (c).”
shall be substituted.

Amendment of
section 384

16.

In the principal Code at the end of section 384, the
following words and sign shall be added, namely-

“In such cases, the registrar shall issue a certificate
regarding termination of the live-in relationship to both
the partners, in a format prescribed by the State
Government.”.

Amendment of
section 385

17.

In section 385 of the principal Code.-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words and sign "such
partner(s)”, the words "those partners" shall be
substituted;

(il) sub-section (2) has been omitted;

(iii} in sub-section (3), for the words and sign "such
partner(s)", the words "those partners" shall be
substituted.




12 STNTEYS A/ATHRT TG(e, 27 W43, 2026 30 (A9 07, 1947 & W)

Amendment of
section 387

i8.

In section 387 of the principal Code, after sub-section (3),
the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely-

“(4) Whoever obtains the consent of any person by
force, coercion or fraud to establish a live-in relationship
shall be punishable with_imprisonment for a term which
may extend to seven years and shall also be liable to fine.
(5) Whoever stays in a live-in relationship in
contravention of sub-section (2) of section 380 shall be
punishable with imprisonment for a term which may
extend to seven years and shall alse be liable to fine:

Provided that, nothing in this sﬁb—sectiom shall

apply to a person who has terminated the live-in
relationship or whose partner has not been heard of for a
period of seven years or more.
(6) Any major person who lives in a live-in relationship
with minor in contravention of sub-section (3) of section
380 shall be punishable with simple imprisonment for a
term which may extend to six months and with fine which
may extend to fifty thousand rupees; and in default of
payment of such fine, with further imprisonment which
may extend to one month.”. “

'—fr“isertio:;of new
sections 390A
and 390B

In the principal code after section 390 the following
sections shall be inserted, namely:—
“390A. Power to cancel regisiration-

The power to cancel any registration relating to
marriage, divorce, live-in relationship or succession shall
lie with the Registrar General appointed under Section 12.
Before the cancelling such registration, the applicant shall
be given opportunity of being heard by the Registrar
General.
390B. Recovery of penalty-

Any penalty imposed under the provisions of this
Code shall be recovered like arrears of land revenue or in
such manner as may be specified by rules made under this
Code.”.

Amendment of
Schedule-2

20.

In the principal Code, in serial number 3 of Class-1 of
Schedule-2, for the word “Widow”, the word “Spouse”
shall be substituted. '




STRIEVS SNSRI Tole, 27 W49, 2026 $0 (1T 07, 1947 & W&&q) = 13

| Savings

21.

Anything done or any action taken under the Uniform
Civil Code, Uttarakhand (Amendment) Ordinance, 2025
(Ordinance No. 03 of 2025) shall be deemed to have
been done or taken under the corresponding provisions

of this Ordinance.

LT. GEN. GURMIT SINGH,
PV.SM UYSM AVSM V.SM (Retd.)
: Governor, Uttarakhand.

By Order,

DHANANJAY CHATURVEDI,
Principal Secretary,

WloTwoyo (arrogo) 02 / et / 26—2026—100-+500 wferat (ﬂTmLé? yaure



